
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

10.0

KAONA FUTHER 2

Customer: PTRHTF60010 System Information Sample Information

SYNLUBE INTERNATIONAL CO LTD

76/1 MOO.7 THACHIN

MUANG SAMUTSAKHON,  74000

THAILAND

Attn: Kittisak Suthithanakom

Tel: 6(681)850-1907

E-Mail: kittisak@synlube.co.th                  

System Volume: 4400 ltr

Bulk Operating Temp: 545F / 285C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02312793

Analyst: Philip Riley 

Sample Date: 08/24/19

Received Date: 10/04/19

Completed: 10/18/19Fluid: EASTMAN THERMINOL XP

Make: 

Recommendation: Not a Petro-Canada Fluid so no parameters with which to make an accurate diagnosis. However, the water

contamination is exteemely high and this causes multiple issues for the fluid. Regardless of product I would recommend a change

and switch to Petro-Canada CALFLO HTF or PURITY FG HTF depending on application. A flush and clean will be essential

based on the competitor product and the condition.

Comments: ppm Water contamination levels are severely high. Water contamination levels are severely high. (GCD) 90%

Distillation Point is severely high. (GCD) 10% Distillation Point is marginally high.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

08/24/19 10/04/19 11y SUPPLY RETURN 367 / 186 8118.0 23.9    0.051 0.040 670 / 355 768 / 409 882 / 472 5.61 

06/23/18 07/13/18 10y SUPPLY/RETURN 376 / 191 14555.4 23.8    0.13 0.116 691 / 366 777 / 414 901 / 483 1.94 

Baseline Data 360 / 182 23.7      630 / 332 781 / 416

Report ID: [02312793] (Generated: 10/18/2019 07:58:08)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2019 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

10.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

08/24/19 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

06/23/18 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

06/23/18

The current fluid has normal viscosity. The low flash point is a concern for the 285C high bulk oil temperature. The water content is extremely high. The fluid

needs to be changed due to the severe water contamination. Water contamination levels are severely high. Water contamination levels are severely high (GCD)

10% Distillation Point is severely high. (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is severely high.

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02312793] (Generated: 10/18/2019 07:58:08)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2019 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

