
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

ENERGY PLANT

Customer: PTRHTF20080 System Information Sample Information

WEST FRASER TIMBER CO LTD

Hwy 584 Bag #1

SUNDRE, AB T0M 1X0 Canada

Attn: BARRY BAY

Tel: (403)638-1189

E-Mail:

BARRY.BAY@WESTFRASER.COM       

System Volume: 110000 ltr

Bulk Operating Temp: 495F / 257C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02321006

Analyst: Gordon Susinski 

Sample Date: 11/13/19

Received Date: 11/19/19

Completed: 11/22/19Fluid: PETRO CANADA PETRO-THERM

Make: DELTECH

Recommendation: Results are normal.  Resample at the next interval to monitor a reduction in the COC flash point, and the

increase in the GCD % <335C.

Comments: 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

11/13/19 11/19/19 12y SAMPLE STATION 406 / 208 14.9 33.1    0.025 0.050 681 / 361 792 / 422 892 / 478 3.89 

09/24/18 10/02/18 11y 432 / 222 14.0 33.0    0.038 0.049 712 / 378 809 / 432 903 / 484 0.00 

05/08/17 05/12/17 10y SUCTION - BACKUP PMP 424 / 218 10.1 33.3    0.044 0.066 704 / 373 814 / 434 916 / 491 1.97 

01/23/17 01/27/17 10y FILL DRAIN LINE 414 / 212 27.6 33.6    0.01 0.033 706 / 375 809 / 431 907 / 486 1.01 

08/26/14 09/10/14 7y FILL DRAIN LINE 423 / 217 42.9 33.0    0.044 0.144 716 / 380 811 / 433 905 / 485 0.00 

Baseline Data 433 / 223 34.2 0.03 720 / 382 817 / 436 900 / 482 1.00 

Report ID: [02321006] (Generated: 11/22/2019 16:08:18)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2019 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

11/13/19 9 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

09/24/18 10 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

05/08/17 12 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

01/23/17 13 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

08/26/14 4 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 3 0 2 2

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

09/24/18

Results are normal.

05/08/17

Note the initial boiling point reduction from previous samples.  Although this result is within normal limits, the reduction in IBP should be noted.A lower initial boiling point indicates that low boilers maybe present in the sample.

 This condition is normally due to thermal degradation of the sample, however, there is no other analysis result to support that this degradation has taken place.  This result can typically be corroborated by a lower flash point,

which in this case it cannot.  This leads us to believe that the result may be too small to measure by the flash point test, or perhaps the result may be due to some other deviation?  This may also be interpreted as the

beginning of thermal degradation process of the system.Low boilers can lead to pump cavitation.All other results are within normal guidelines.We suggest re sampling in 3 months’ time to corroborate the reduced IBP result.

01/23/17

Results are normal.  Resample at the next PM interval.

08/26/14

Sample is in excellent condition. Sample again at the regular one year interval.

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02321006] (Generated: 11/22/2019 16:08:18)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2019 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

