
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.8

[Pembina Kakwa 8-13-63-5W6] Phase 2 Heat Medium

Customer: PTRHTF20062 System Information Sample Information

Pembina Gas Services

GRANDE PRAIRIE, AB T8V 7K2 Canada

Attn: Nicolas Brooks

Tel: (403)874-8047

E-Mail: nbrooks@pembina.com                

                                                                  

System Volume: 84000 ltr

Bulk Operating Temp: 482F / 250C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02335524

Analyst: Clinton Buhler 

Sample Date: 01/07/20

Received Date: 02/03/20

Completed: 02/20/20

Clinton Buhler

Clinton.Buhler@PetroCanadaLSP.com

Fluid: PETRO CANADA CALFLO AF

Make: HEATECH

Recommendation: Sample results indicate that the fluid is suitable for continued service.Please re-sample in 12 months

Comments: (GCD) 10% Distillation Point is marginally high.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

01/07/20 02/03/20 5y SLIPSTREAM 428 / 220 0.00 29.6    0.040 0.043 720 / 382 797 / 425 886 / 474 0.00 

01/22/19 02/04/19 5y FILTER POT 432 / 222 21.9 29.3    0.048 0.044 668 / 353 772 / 411 876 / 469 3.91 

01/22/18 01/29/18 4y 403 / 206 33.2 28.9    0.03 0.067 685 / 363 782 / 417 896 / 480 1.28 

01/31/17 02/13/17 3y SLIP STRM FLTR PP DC 392 / 200 6.9 28.7    0.01 0.054 694 / 368 796 / 425 906 / 485 1.48 

01/20/16 01/28/16 2y FILTER CANISTER 399 / 204 105.5 23.3    0.050 0.023 691 / 366 795 / 424 897 / 481 1.96 

Baseline Data 435 / 224 32.7 0.03 693 / 367 790 / 421 887 / 475 2.5  

Report ID: [02335524] (Generated: 02/20/2020 11:30:48)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2020 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.8

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

01/07/20 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 6 0

01/22/19 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 6 0

01/22/18 3 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 13 0

01/31/17 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 5 0

01/20/16 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 16 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 270

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

01/22/19

Sample results indicate the fluid is suitable for continued service.Please re-sample in 12 months

01/22/18

Sample results indicate that the fluid is suitable for continued service. Consider sampling again in 12 months.

01/31/17

(GCD) 90% Distillation Point is marginally high. TAN and Viscosity are within spec. Flash point is marginally lower then normal however fluid is suitable for

continued use. Resample in 6 months.  (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is marginally high.

01/20/16

Oil looks fine and is suitable for continued use.

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02335524] (Generated: 02/20/2020 11:30:48)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2020 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

