
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

HEATTRANSFER

Customer: PTRHTF10228 System Information Sample Information

BEAUFLOR USA

ONE BEAUFLOR WAY

WHITE, GA 30184 USA

Attn: Marcus Abbot

Tel: (678)535-5800

E-Mail: misty.jones@beauflor.us              

                                                                  

System Volume: 15000 gal

Bulk Operating Temp: 485F / 252C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02342602

Analyst: Manny Garcia 

Sample Date: 03/04/20

Received Date: 03/10/20

Completed: 03/13/20

Manny Garcia

manuel.garcia@petrocanadalsp.com

Fluid: MOBIL MOBILTHERM 43

Make: WEISAUP

Recommendation: Fluid is suitable for use.  Please re-send sample in March 2021

Comments: Much improvement in fluid quality since the January sample was analyzed.  Water has cleared up.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

03/04/20 03/10/20 4y PUMP NEAR BOILER 410 / 210 42.3 30.5    0.089 0.048 693 / 367 793 / 423 885 / 474 1.04 

01/22/20 01/28/20 4y 417 / 214 948.2 30.8    0.032 0.059 690 / 365 786 / 419 874 / 468 1.68 

Baseline Data 388 / 198 30.6 0.13 685 / 363 876 / 469

Report ID: [02342602] (Generated: 03/13/2020 17:15:33)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2020 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

03/04/20 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

01/22/20 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

01/22/20

High water content present in sample. Also light precipitate in the sample was indicated by the lab. Oil is otherwise in good condition. Once the system is

converted to Petro-Canada HTF, a sample may be sent for testing to establish a baseline.Water contamination levels are abnormally high. Water contamination

levels are abnormally high.. ppm Water contamination levels are abnormally high.

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02342602] (Generated: 03/13/2020 17:15:33)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2020 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

