
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

MODIFIED ROOM HOT OIL SYSTEM

Customer: PTRHTF10069 System Information Sample Information

CERTAINTEED - SAINT GOBAIN

3303 EAST 4TH AVENUE

SHAKOPEE, MN 55379 USA

Attn: Patrick Wallace

Tel: 

E-Mail: patrick.wallace@saint-

gobain.com                                               

System Volume: 4158 gal

Bulk Operating Temp: 500F / 260C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02362002

Analyst: Neil Buchanan 

Sample Date: 06/18/20

Received Date: 06/29/20

Completed: 07/14/20

Neil Buchanan

neil.buchanan@hollyfrontier.com

Fluid: PETRO CANADA CALFLO AF

Make: 

Recommendation: Sample properties look good and it is free of contamination. Resample next interval to monitor.

Comments: 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

06/18/20 06/29/20 0.0y main system 417 / 214 14.5 24.4    0.06 0.103 689 / 365 781 / 416 881 / 471 2.49 

09/24/19 10/21/19 0.0y MAIN SYSTEM FLOW 396 / 202 19.1 26.0    0.094 0.093 695 / 368 778 / 415 868 / 464 0.00 

09/30/18 10/10/18 0.0y 399 / 204 17.0 23.9    0.02 0.028 674 / 357 754 / 401 859 / 459 1.90 

09/02/17 09/12/17 4.0y MAIN SYSTEM FLOW 392 / 200 10.1 23.5    0.086 0.037 683 / 362 772 / 411 867 / 464 2.42 

05/14/16 05/24/16 0.0y MAIN SYSTEM FLOW 399 / 204 3.4 22.4    0.086 0.198 683 / 362 762 / 405 855 / 457 0.93 

Baseline Data 435 / 224 32.7 0.03 693 / 367 790 / 421 887 / 475 2.5  

Report ID: [02362002] (Generated: 05/12/2021 15:32:09)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2021 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

06/18/20 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 38 0

09/24/19 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 34 0

09/30/18 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 33 0

09/02/17 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 32 0

05/14/16 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 38 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 270

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

09/24/19

The oil is holding steady with the properties remaining normal from sample to sample.  Contamination by asphalt, water or other elements is insignificant or non-

detectable.  No actions needed at this time. Re-sample at next scheduled interval  (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is marginally low.

09/30/18

The results are consistent with previous history.  Resample at next scheduled interval.  (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is abnormally low.

09/02/17

The oil condition is consistent with previous samples.  The viscosity remains low but the flash point is staying strong.  No immediate action is required at this time

but you can vent the low boilers out and replace the lost volume with fresh oil as preventative measure.  Re-sample at next normal interval.  (GCD) 90%

Distillation Point is marginally low.

05/14/16

(GCD) 90% Distillation Point is marginally low. Pentane insolubles have increased but are still below the 0.5% condemning limit.

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02362002] (Generated: 05/12/2021 15:32:09)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2021 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

