
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

1.2

[PROCESSING ROOM] REACTOR 341

Customer: PTRHTF30155 System Information Sample Information

HB Fuller (Royal Adhesive & Sealant...

266 Humberline Dr

Toronto, ON M9W 5X1 Canada

Attn: Rajesh Kumar

Tel: (416)679-5676

E-Mail: rajesh.kumar@hbfuller.com          

                                                                  

System Volume: 1500 g

Bulk Operating Temp: 302F / 150C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02367979

Analyst: Lynn Billings 

Sample Date: 08/03/20

Received Date: 07/31/20

Completed: 08/06/20

Lynn Billings

lynn.billings@petrocanadalsp.com

Fluid: PETRO CANADA CALFLO AF

Make: STERLCO

Recommendation: Recommendation:  The sample shows a slightly high level of acids as shown with the acid number of 0.29.  Oxidation causes the oil to form

acids.  Oil degrading by reacting with oxygen from air in the expansion tank without nitrogen blanketing (not sure whether you have nitrogen blanketing).

Depending on the volume of the system, if the acid number continues to increase, a partial oil replacement (sweeten) is a possibility to reduce acid number,

postpone fouling and costly shutdown.  The GCD profile is consistent with Calflo AF, except for a few low boilers.  The viscosity and water are consistent as well. 

Wear metals indicate some copper, iron and lead.  The flash point is fine and there appears to be some pentane insolubles (0.086).  Always ensure that the

sample line is flushed thoroughly to remove any insolubles that may have accumulated over time, before the sample is taken.  We recommend to re-sample in six

months, to give us some additionally data since this system has been running for approximately six years, without any sample analysis.

Comments: Acid Number (AN) is abnormally high.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

08/03/20 07/31/20 7y REACTOR JACKET 453 / 234 2.6 32.3    0.29 0.086 705 / 374 802 / 428 902 / 483 1.22 

Baseline Data 435 / 224 32.7 0.03 693 / 367 790 / 421 887 / 475 2.5  

Report ID: [02367979] (Generated: 08/06/2020 13:56:40)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2020 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

1.2

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

08/03/20 5 0 0 0 6 2 0 0 0 0 4 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 218 3

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 270

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

 

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02367979] (Generated: 08/06/2020 13:56:40)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2020 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

