
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

4.0

THERMALOILSYSTEM

Customer: PTRHTF30156 System Information Sample Information

M/T HINCH SPIRIT

IMO No. 9508940

Toronto, ON . Canada

Attn: Chief Engineer

Tel: 

E-Mail: his.en@mckeil.com                      

                                                                  

System Volume: 5500 ltr

Bulk Operating Temp: Not Specified

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02368167

Analyst: Behshad Sabah 

Sample Date: 07/27/20

Received Date: 08/04/20

Completed: 09/08/20

Behshad Sabah

behshad.sabah@hollyfrontier.com

Fluid: PETRO CANADA CALFLO HTF

Make: AALBORG

Recommendation: the oil sample test results look ok. i think you are topping up the Castrol Perfecto HT 5 with Calflo HTF. as

result, the Sulfur PPM is going down from original oil ( Perfecto HT 5) as we do not have this additive in our formulation. some

water in the system but with nature of your applicaiton ( Ship), it is not that high. no action at this point is necessary.

Comments: Water contamination levels are marginally high. ppm Water contamination levels are marginally high. (GCD) 90%

Distillation Point is abnormally low. Magnesium ppm levels are notably high. Calcium, phosphorus and sulfur ppm levels are

notably high.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

07/27/20 08/04/20 10.0y 450 / 232 431.9 32.1    0.19 0.127 735 / 391 814 / 434 883 / 473 0.39 

01/25/20 02/18/20 0.0y 31.9    0.132

Baseline Data 448 / 231 35.20 .1   712 / 378 810 / 432 910 / 488 1.75 

Report ID: [02368167] (Generated: 08/17/2021 15:05:04)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2021 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

4.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 Z
in

c

07/27/20 201 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 1 16 9 0 0 0 2 0 0 28 33 0 34 3

01/25/20 138 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 3 15 9 0 0 0 1 0 0 21 31 0 16 3

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 280

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

01/25/20

Confirm the source of the lubricant being utilized for top-up/fill. Resample at the next service interval to monitor. Lubritest recommends using HTTFL sample kits for heat transfer fluids.  Please contact us at

1-800-268-2131 and provide a purchase order for $245 + HST in order to conduct additional testing (boiling points @ 10%, 50%, and 90%, percent boiling < 335°C, and solids) to determine the suitability for

continued use.All component wear rates are normal. The system cleanliness is acceptable for your target ISO 4406 cleanliness code. The system and fluid cleanliness is acceptable. Additive levels indicate

the addition of a different brand, or type of oil. The AN level is acceptable for this fluid. The condition of the fluid is acceptable for the time in service (unconfirmed).

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02368167] (Generated: 08/17/2021 15:05:04)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2021 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

