
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

3.2

HEAT TRANSFER SYSTEM

Customer: PTRHTF10019 System Information Sample Information

LAKESIDE INDUSTRIES-PLANT 110

PLANT 110 - 4850 NW FRONT AVE

PORTLAND, OR 97210 US

Attn: PATRICK L. DUNIGAN

Tel: (503)227-6136

E-Mail:

pat.dunigan@lakesideindustries.com

System Volume: 409 gal

Bulk Operating Temp: 360F / 182C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02395264

Analyst: Ron LeBlanc 

Sample Date: 09/28/20

Received Date: 12/30/20

Completed: 01/05/21

Ron LeBlanc

Ronald.LeBlancSr@HFSinclair.com

Fluid: PETRO CANADA PETRO-THERM

Make: HYWAY HEAT GENCOR

Recommendation: Acid Number (AN) is elevated indicating oxidized fluid. Viscosity is elevated due to thickening over time. 

(GCD) 90% Distillation Point is severely high most likely due to AN being elevated.   Adding some new oil could possibly improve

the typicals.  Resample in 3 months.

Comments: (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is severely high. Acid Number (AN) is abnormally high.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

09/28/20 12/30/20 80.0m Return after filter 432 / 222 19.4 37.1    0.48 0.213 742 / 394 844 / 451 948 / 509 0.01 

11/05/19 12/30/19 69.0m RETURN 439 / 226 11.8 36.8    0.274 0.220 730 / 388 812 / 433 910 / 488 0.00 

12/02/16 12/15/16 33.0m BEFORE FILTER 428 / 220 13.3 36.5    0.05 0.108 714 / 379 818 / 437 957 / 514 1.46 

10/15/15 10/30/15 0.0m AFTER FILTER 430 / 221 22.8 36.4    0.08 0.094 713 / 379 811 / 433 922 / 495 1.41 

03/05/14 03/20/14 9.0m AFTER FILTER RETURN 441 / 227 0.00 37.0    0.03 0.160 714 / 379 817 / 436 925 / 496 1.62 

Baseline Data 433 / 223 34.2 0.03 720 / 382 817 / 436 900 / 482 1.00 

Report ID: [02395264] (Generated: 11/17/2023 12:00:28)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2023 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

3.2

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

09/28/20 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

11/05/19 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1

12/02/16 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

10/15/15 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

03/05/14 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 3 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

11/05/19

Sample is normal. Sample again at next scheduled date.FG

12/02/16

(GCD) 90% Distillation Point is severely high.  (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is severely high.

10/15/15

The 90% distillation point has remained consistent over the last 4 samples.    TAN has increased slightly over the last 4 samples.   Resample in 6 months.  (GCD)

90% Distillation Point is marginally high.

03/05/14

The oil condition appears to be similar to what it was in Feb 2012.  Test results indicate the oil is in good condition and safe to use.  Sample yearly to monitor the

fluid condition.

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02395264] (Generated: 11/17/2023 12:00:28)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2023 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

