
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

2.4

HEAT TRANSFER

Customer: PTRHTF40134 System Information Sample Information

EUROPA CUISSON

14 RUE DE LA TERRE A BRISQUES

TOURNAI,  7522 Belgium

Attn: Fabrice Duhamel

Tel: (326)976-5050

E-Mail:

fabrice.duhamel@europacuisson.com     

System Volume: 6000 ltr

Bulk Operating Temp: 509F / 265C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02396801

Analyst: Philip Riley 

Sample Date: 01/06/21

Received Date: 01/11/21

Completed: 01/14/21

Philip Riley

philip.riley@petrocanadalsp.com

Fluid: PETRO CANADA PURITY FG HEAT TRANSFER FLUID

Make: GARIONI

Recommendation: Generally in good condition with the exception of the water content that will cause issues. This may also be a root

cause of the pentane insoluble being high, as the stress of water present in the system can lead to degradation, and is already showing

emulsification. Please look to remove the water and perhaps bring in filtration if it is possible to conduct this safely. Once done this fluid

will last a longer period of time. Other parameters are all as expected and the fluid, with the recommendations, is fit for further use.

Comments: Water contamination levels are abnormally high. Water contamination levels are abnormally high.. ppm Water

contamination levels are abnormally high. Pentane Insolubles levels are abnormally high.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

01/06/21 01/11/21 5y Generator 432 / 222 844.1 33.1    0.97 0.453 716 / 380 809 / 432 905 / 485 2.55 

Baseline Data 459 / 237 37.12 0.90 721 / 383 807 / 431 892 / 478 1.5  

Report ID: [02396801] (Generated: 01/14/2021 10:45:41)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2021 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

2.4

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

01/06/21 15 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 2 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 79 4

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 230

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

 

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02396801] (Generated: 01/14/2021 10:45:41)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2021 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

