
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

5.6

[SEATTLE WA] GENCOR HYWAY 200

Customer: PTRHTF10245 System Information Sample Information

ICON MATERIALS

1115 S 96TH ST

SEATTLE, WA 98108 USA

Attn: Pat Healy

Tel: (253)261-4473

E-Mail: patrick.healy@iconmaterials.com 

                                                                  

System Volume: 600 gal

Bulk Operating Temp: 425F / 218C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02411282

Analyst: Ron LeBlanc 

Sample Date: 03/16/21

Received Date: 03/25/21

Completed: 03/31/21

Ron LeBlanc

Ronald.LeBlancSr@hollyfrontier.com

Fluid: CHEVRON HEAT TRANSFER OIL 46

Make: 

Recommendation: Viscosity is extremely high due to extended life of the fluid.  The AN is extremely high indicating oil has been

oxidized for an extended time.   Pentane insolubles indicate deposits possible in the oil.   System should be cleaned, flushed and

refilled with fresh oil when time permits.   Cleaning/flushing instructions will be given to customer.

Comments: Pentane Insolubles levels are severely high. Acid Number (AN) is severely high. Visc @ 40°C is severely high.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

03/16/21 03/25/21 10.0y 478 / 248 87.1 193     2.57 8.68 733 / 390 810 / 432 922 / 495 0.21 

Baseline Data 464 / 240 41.1      727 / 386 828 / 442 932 / 500 1.4  

Report ID: [02411282] (Generated: 03/31/2021 09:07:26)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2021 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

5.6

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

03/16/21 188 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 6 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 6 4 0 2

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

 

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02411282] (Generated: 03/31/2021 09:07:26)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2021 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

