
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

3.6

[SIMONETTE GAS PLANT / LSD: 9-6-63-25-W5] H620 STABILIZER SIMONETTE

PLANTCustomer: PTRHTF20187 System Information Sample Information

KEYERA ENERGY- SIMONETTE GAS

PLANT

PO BOX 58

VALLEYVIEW, AB T0H 3N0 Canada

Attn: Brody Shilka

Tel: (780)835-1861

E-Mail: brody_shilka@keyera.com           

System Volume: 18000 ltr

Bulk Operating Temp: 446F / 230C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02421971

Analyst: Clinton Buhler 

Sample Date: 05/11/21

Received Date: 05/18/21

Completed: 05/28/21

Clinton Buhler

Clinton.Buhler@hollyfrontier.com

Fluid: PETRO CANADA PETRO-THERM

Make: PETROTECH

Recommendation: Sample results indicate that the fluid is in suitable condition for continued service. Results do show potential contamination

with process fluid and/or thermal degradation as indicated by 9.48% low boiling vapor content and elevated solids content. Venting of the system

is advised to reduce the low boiling vapor content of the fluid. Solids at 0.511% may be associated with thermal degradation (fouling) Filtering

can be beneficial in reducing solids content. Please make sure the next sample is taken from pump discharge and that the sample valve and

tubing is thoroughly purged so we have confidence that the solids content is representative. After thorough venting, please re-sample in 6

months.

Comments: Pentane Insolubles levels are abnormally high. (GCD) 10% Distillation Point is abnormally low. (GCD) % < 335°C is marginally high.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

05/11/21 05/18/21 45.0m Pump discharge 424 / 218 0.00 29.7    0.02 0.511 635 / 335 794 / 423 897 / 481 9.48 

11/19/18 11/29/18 15.0m 374 / 190 187.7 22.5    0.029 0.019 609 / 321 737 / 392 842 / 450 12.71

04/05/18 04/16/18 7.0m 345 / 174 10.3 21.5    0.02 0.014 556 / 291 803 / 428 915 / 490 16.47

01/22/18 01/29/18 5.0m 356 / 180 4.2 23.0    0.015 0.036 550 / 288 789 / 421 906 / 485 19.74

10/04/17 10/17/17 42.0m 360 / 182 23.3 21.3    0.035 0.043 551 / 288 793 / 423 908 / 486 18.43

Baseline Data 433 / 223 34.2 0.03 720 / 382 817 / 436 900 / 482 1.00 

Report ID: [02421971] (Generated: 05/28/2021 12:10:29)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2021 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

3.6

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

05/11/21 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 5 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

11/19/18 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

04/05/18 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

01/22/18 4 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

10/04/17 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

11/19/18

Compared with the previous condition of the fluid there are improvements in Flash Point and low boiler vapor content. Viscosity and distillation curve temperatures are

still low. The fluid is suitable for further use. Please keep venting on a regular basis and re-sample in 6 months.  (GCD) 10% Distillation Point is severely low. (GCD)

90% Distillation Point is severely low. (GCD) % < 335°C is abnormally high. (GCD) 50% Distillation Point is abnormally low. COC Flash Point is marginally low.

04/05/18

Condition of the fluid is similar to condition in January. Viscosity is very low, Flash Point is low, % boil-off below 335C. is high. The condition is believed to be the result of mixing

with a low viscosity fluid (Therminol 59) with some additional thermal degradation indicated by the low 10% GCD temperature. Please vent off low boiler vapor to atmosphere

and resample in 3 months.  (GCD) % < 335°C is severely high. (GCD) 10% Distillation Point is severely low. COC Flash Point is abnormally low. Visc @ 40°C is abnormally low.

01/22/18

Like the fluid in the Refridge system, the condition has remained the same. Viscosity, Flash Point and 10% GCD temp are low and low boiler vapor content is high. (% boil-off <335C) A low boiler vapor

content of almost 20% is a problem for circulation of the fluid through the system. Pumps can vapor lock and damage due to cavitation. It's recommended to top-up with 10% of the total volume to lower the

low boiler vapor content. This will take several steps of topping-up which can take place at a 6 months interval followed by taking a sample. The fluid is suitable for use.  (GCD) % < 335°C is severely high.

(GCD) 10% Distillation Point is severely low. COC Flash Point is marginally low.

10/04/17

A combination of low viscosity, Flash Point and 10% GCD temperature plus a very high low boiler vapor content (% boil-off <335C.) would normally indicate thermal degradation but since fluid service life has

only been 42 days this condition could be the result of one of the following: 1. Mixing with another (low viscosity) heat transfer fluid. 2. Contamination with a process fluid. 3. Ingress of blanket gas when

blanket gas pressure is too high and natural gas is in use. Please identify the problem and rectify  (GCD) % < 335°C is severely high. (GCD) 10% Distillation Point is severely low. Visc @ 40°C is abnormally

low. COC Flash Point is marginally low.

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02421971] (Generated: 05/28/2021 12:10:29)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2021 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

