
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

1.2

SYSTEM #2

Customer: PTRHTF10073 System Information Sample Information

SHEPHERD COLOR

4539 DUES DRIVE

CINCINNATI, OH 45246 USA

Attn: Trevor Jasper

Tel: (513)874-0714

E-Mail: tjasper@shepherdcolor.com         

                                                                  

System Volume: 1000 gal

Bulk Operating Temp: 420F / 216C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02424453

Analyst: Joe Goecke 

Sample Date: 05/24/21

Received Date: 06/01/21

Completed: 06/15/21

Joe Goecke

Joe.goecke@hollyfrontier.com

Fluid: PETRO CANADA CALFLO AF

Make: FIRST THERMAL

Recommendation: System slightly high in sodium but not too bad. Flash point viscosity and low boilers all in great shape.

Continue to use and resample at regular schedule.

Comments: Sodium ppm levels are abnormally high.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

05/24/21 06/01/21 0.0y Reactor outlet 428 / 220 26.6 31.4    0.12 0.120 703 / 373 792 / 422 901 / 483 1.17 

03/17/14 03/26/14 9.3y 405 / 207 31.9 30.5    0.058 0.221 686 / 364 788 / 420 877 / 470 3.11 

12/14/10 12/21/10 6.0y PUMP SUCTION 408 / 209 15 31.3    0.01 0.013 697 / 369 790 / 421 884 / 474 2.533

03/23/10 03/25/10 6.0y CIRCULATING PUMP STA 403 / 206 33 30.7    0.1  0.028 690 / 366 783 / 417 875 / 468 2.849

06/03/09 06/03/09 5.0y 441 / 227 53 30.7    0.1  0.24 682 / 361 882 / 472 3.6  

Baseline Data 435 / 224 32.7 0.03 693 / 367 790 / 421 887 / 475 2.5  

Report ID: [02424453] (Generated: 06/15/2021 13:10:03)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2021 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

1.2

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

05/24/21 6 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 4 34 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 226 0

03/17/14 10 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 78 0 0 0 0 3 0 0 0 2 0 60 0

12/14/10 6 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 58 0 0 0 0 2 0 0 0 2 0 51 0

03/23/10 5 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 69 0 0 0 0 2 0 0 0 0 0 69 0

06/03/09 9 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 1 84 0 0 3 0 0 0 72 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 270

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

03/17/14

contamination with coolant appears to be slightly worse.  Iron wear has increased slightly.  The source on ingress needs to be identified and eliminated. Sample at

1/2 interval  Sodium ppm levels are severely high.

12/14/10

Not much has changed since the last sample.  Everything looks good.  The fluid is suitable foir further use based on these results.  Keep up the good work and re-

sample in 9 months or so to monitor the fluid condition.

03/23/10

The results are consistent with past history.  No degradation or contamination seem ot have occurred since the last sample.  We suggest to resample near

December 2010.

06/03/09

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02424453] (Generated: 06/15/2021 13:10:03)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2021 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

