
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

3.6

[LSD: 14-01-42-07W5] HEAT TRANSFER

Customer: PTRHTF20255 System Information Sample Information

OBSIDIAN ENERGY

14-01-42-07W5

ROCKY MOUNTAIN HOUSE, AB T4T

1T1 Canada

Attn: Greg Kent

Tel: 

E-Mail: greg.kent@obsidianenergy.com   

System Volume: 0 gal

Bulk Operating Temp: 599F / 315C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02427529

Analyst: Terry Veenstra 

Sample Date: 06/10/21

Received Date: 06/16/21

Completed: 07/06/21

Terry Veenstra

terry.veenstra@hollyfrontier.com

Fluid: PETRO CANADA PETRO-THERM

Make: PROPAK

Recommendation: Pentane Insolubles are very high. Consider filtration of oil. Total Acid number in moderately high. Ensure gas

blanket is in place and periodically vent system to eliminate low boilers.

Comments: Pentane Insolubles levels are severely high. Acid Number (AN) is abnormally high. (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is

abnormally high.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

06/10/21 06/16/21 0.0h DISCH. OF PUMP 442 / 228 92.5 37.0    0.53 0.561 715 / 380 798 / 426 930 / 499 0.37 

Baseline Data 433 / 223 34.2 0.03 720 / 382 817 / 436 900 / 482 1.00 

Report ID: [02427529] (Generated: 07/06/2021 18:07:27)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2021 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

3.6

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

06/10/21 26 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 3 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

 

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02427529] (Generated: 07/06/2021 18:07:27)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2021 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

