
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

B6/B8 HOT OIL SYSTEM

Customer: PTRHTF30052 System Information Sample Information

I G MACHINES AND FIBER

87 ORENDA RD.

BRAMPTON, ON L6W 1V7 Canada

Attn: Alan Zhao

Tel: (905)457-2880

E-Mail: alan.zhao@iko.com                      

                                                                  

System Volume: 16000 ltr

Bulk Operating Temp: 392F / 200C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02440262

Analyst: Adam Koscielak 

Sample Date: 08/20/21

Received Date: 08/24/21

Completed: 09/07/21

Adam Koscielak

adam.koscielak@hollyfrontier.com

Fluid: PETRO CANADA PETRO-THERM

Make: IND. CUMBUSTION & EQ

Recommendation: Analysis indicates the fluid results are typical for Petro-Therm in service.  GCD data is typical for Petro-Therm

in service, no appreciable level of low boilers detected.  Flash Point typical at 226°C.  Pentane insolubles content is at 0.174,

down from 0.466 and typical for fluid in service.  Fluid is suitable for continued service.  Sample at next yearly frequency.

Comments: 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

08/20/21 08/24/21 0.0y 439 / 226 15.3 35.5    0.13 0.174 730 / 388 815 / 435 911 / 489 0.51 

07/30/19 08/12/19 0.0y PIPING 457 / 236 25.8 37.0    0.414 0.466 692 / 367 779 / 415 879 / 471 0.84 

03/21/18 03/27/18 0.0y 421 / 216 18.4 36.2    0.20 0.041 704 / 373 800 / 427 905 / 485 1.95 

Baseline Data 433 / 223 34.2 0.03 720 / 382 817 / 436 900 / 482 1.00 

Report ID: [02440262] (Generated: 01/18/2022 10:34:13)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2022 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

08/20/21 8 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

07/30/19 9 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

03/21/18 3 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

07/30/19

The acid number has doubled since last test.  Thus, more acidic components in your fluid.  The pentane insolubles have drastically increased.  The rise in acid number, and slight

rise in viscosity and flash point indicates oxidation of the fluid.  Filtration will assist in reducing solids in the fluid.  The 90% GCD is also marginally on the low side.  Would suggest

a resample of this unit in 6 months time. Pentane Insolubles levels are abnormally high. Acid Number (AN) is abnormally high. (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is marginally low.

03/21/18

Fluid appears to be fine for continued service.

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02440262] (Generated: 01/18/2022 10:34:13)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2022 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

