
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

1.2

B01-19

Customer: PTRHTF10011 System Information Sample Information

G.F.S. CHEMICAL

851 Mckinley Avenue

COLUMBUS, OH 43222 USA

Attn: Jamie Walters

Tel: (800)446-4910

E-Mail: jamie@gfschemicals.com             

                                                                  

System Volume: 20 gal

Bulk Operating Temp: 350F / 177C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02448273

Analyst: Joe Goecke 

Sample Date: 05/21/21

Received Date: 10/05/21

Completed: 10/12/21

Joe Goecke

Joe.goecke@hollyfrontier.com

Fluid: PETRO CANADA CALFLO AF

Make: CHROMALOX

Recommendation: Acid number is a little high, Continue to use with no issues but resample at 1/2 the previous interval.

Comments: Acid Number (AN) is abnormally high.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

05/21/21 10/05/21 13.0y 432 / 222 6.3 32.5    0.42 0.087 697 / 370 791 / 421 893 / 478 0.90 

11/29/16 12/20/16 0.0y 412 / 211 284.0 33.0    0.375 0.031 691 / 366 792 / 422 899 / 482 1.53 

03/18/13 03/28/13 0.0y RECIRC LINE 419 / 215 226.6 32.9    0.16 0.121 686 / 364 785 / 419 890 / 477 2.20 

06/10/09 06/10/09 32.5    0.35 

Baseline Data 435 / 224 32.7 0.03 693 / 367 790 / 421 887 / 475 2.5  

Report ID: [02448273] (Generated: 10/12/2021 21:50:00)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2021 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

1.2

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

05/21/21 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 4 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 225 0

11/29/16 2 0 2 0 5 0 0 0 0 0 4 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 221 1

03/18/13 2 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 5 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 214 0

06/10/09 5 0 1 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 5 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 199 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 270

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

11/29/16

Sample shows no major issues, Acid number rising.  Continue with use and resample at next scheduled interval  Acid Number (AN) is abnormally high.

03/18/13

The test results indicate the fluid is suitable for further use.  Additive balance is healthy, viscosity and flash point are just like fresh oil.

06/10/09

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02448273] (Generated: 10/12/2021 21:50:00)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2021 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

