
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

ENERGY PLANT HOT OIL

Customer: PTRHTF20043 System Information Sample Information

WEST FRASER LVI

PO BOX 1737

ROCKY MT HOUSE, AB T4T 1B3

Canada

Attn: Renny Ceccato

Tel: 

E-Mail: renny.ceccato@westfraser.com   

System Volume: 38000 ltr

Bulk Operating Temp: 500F / 260C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02461907

Analyst: Yutong Gao 

Sample Date: 11/28/21

Received Date: 12/14/21

Completed: 01/05/22

Yutong Gao

yutong.gao@hollyfrontier.com

Fluid: PETRO CANADA PETRO-THERM

Make: WELLONS

Recommendation: The current fluid has normal viscosity, flash point and distillation points. There is minimum oxidation, and

virtually no water contamination. Please continue to operate and take one sample in 12 months to monitor the conditions.

Comments: 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

11/28/21 12/14/21 43.0m 460 / 238 17.9 36.6    0.16 0.105 723 / 384 812 / 434 905 / 485 1.46 

11/28/21 12/08/21 84.0m HOT OIL PUMP 414 / 212 25.5 36.4    0.23 0.153 733 / 390 823 / 439 918 / 492 1.41 

05/20/21 06/11/21 0.0m 439 / 226 68.0 36.6    0.13 0.089 720 / 382 806 / 430 915 / 491 1.77 

11/06/20 11/17/20 30.0m HOT OIL PUMP 421 / 216 59.3 36.4    0.19 0.119 734 / 390 824 / 440 919 / 493 1.44 

01/31/20 02/07/20 21.0m HOT OIL PUMP 442 / 228 58.5 37.1    0.570 0.177 712 / 378 792 / 422 882 / 472 0.00 

Baseline Data 433 / 223 34.2 0.03 720 / 382 817 / 436 900 / 482 1.00 

Report ID: [02461907] (Generated: 01/05/2022 16:23:04)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2022 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

11/28/21 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 6 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0

11/28/21 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 6 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0

05/20/21 2 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 8 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0

11/06/20 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 9 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0

01/31/20 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 9 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 2 0 0 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

11/28/21

The current fluid has normal viscosity, distillation point and flash point. There is minimum oil oxidation and very low water content. It is suitable for further

operation. Please take one sample in 12 months to monitor the conditions.

05/20/21

The current fluid has normal viscosity, low acid number and low solid contents. There are correct distillation points and minimum third party contaminants. Please

continue to run this fluid, and take one sample in 12 months to monitor the conditions.

11/06/20

(GCD) 90% Distillation Point is marginally high.  All other results are within normal guidelines.  Resample next sample period and continue to monitor the system. 

(GCD) 90% Distillation Point is marginally high.

01/31/20

It appears that the oil has experienced a sudden increase in Acid Number.  The acid number is a measure of the acidic compounds in the oil & increases in the acid number could be due to the formation of

oxidation by products in the oil. This value will increase exponentially once the process begins. Tendencies are for sludge and deposits to increase and corrosion to occur if the fluid.  Since the Acid Number

has increased a great deal in 2 months, and there is no substantial increase in the Pentane insolubles, could this sample have been taken from a port where these by products are allowed to collect? 

Resample to determine if the result is accurate.    Acid Number (AN) is abnormally high.

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02461907] (Generated: 01/05/2022 16:23:04)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2022 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

