
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.8

C-38-C/94-H-4

Customer: PTRHTF20216 System Information Sample Information

TOURMALINE OIL

103, 6911-100 AVE

FORT ST. JOHN, BC V1J 1T8 Canada

Attn: Brian Plontke

Tel: (780)524-9780

E-Mail: brian.plontke@tourmalineoil.com 

                                                                  

System Volume: 105000 ltr

Bulk Operating Temp: 410F / 210C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02476626

Analyst: Clinton Buhler 

Sample Date: 03/02/22

Received Date: 03/10/22

Completed: 03/15/22

Clinton Buhler

Clinton.Buhler@HFSinclair.com

Fluid: CHEVRON HEAT TRANSFER OIL 46

Make: HEAT TECK

Recommendation: Sample results indicate the fluid is in suitable condition for continued service.Please re-sample in 12 months

Comments: (GCD) 10% Distillation Point is marginally high.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

03/02/22 03/10/22 8.0y filter pot of H807 450 / 232 202.1 39.1    0.01 0.053 745 / 396 838 / 448 935 / 502 0.46 

02/04/22 02/10/22 8.0y SLIP STREAM FILTER 460 / 238 205.9 39.3    0.06 0.077 754 / 401 841 / 450 937 / 503 0.00 

Baseline Data 464 / 240 41.1      727 / 386 828 / 442 932 / 500 1.4  

Report ID: [02476626] (Generated: 01/30/2023 15:15:41)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2023 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.8

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

03/02/22 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0

02/04/22 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

02/04/22

Note: This system is a combination of chevron heat transfer oil 46 and Petro-Therm. Expected mix is 72 m3 of chevron and 33 m3 of Petro-Therm.Sample results

indicate the fluid is in suitable condition for continued service.Please re-sample in 12 months  (GCD) 10% Distillation Point is marginally high.

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02476626] (Generated: 01/30/2023 15:15:41)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2023 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

