
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

9.2

PAPIOCA DEVELOPMENT CORP

Customer: PTRHTF60010 System Information Sample Information

SYNLUBE INTERNATIONAL CO LTD

76/1 MOO.7 THACHIN

MUANG SAMUTSAKHON,  74000

THAILAND

Attn: CHERNPORN CHOBKUI

Tel: 034421290

E-Mail: chernporn@synlube.co.th             

System Volume: 6500 ltr

Bulk Operating Temp: 302F / 150C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02490270

Analyst: Bill Quesnel CLS,OMA II,MLA-

III,LLA-I 

Sample Date: 05/01/22

Received Date: 05/24/22

Completed: 05/27/22

Bill Quesnel CLS,OMA II,MLA-III,LLA-I

Fluid: EASTMAN THERMINOL 55

Make: SCHERRER

Recommendation: We can see that there was a near complete fluid change, however, the system still has high pentane insoluble,

acid number (AN).  The viscosity has been restored close to the original value, so the heating efficiency should improve

dramatically.  Recommend that you resample in six (6) months to monitor.

Comments: Iron ppm levels are abnormal. Pentane Insolubles levels are severely high. Acid Number (AN) is severely high.

(GCD) 10% Distillation Point is severely high. (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is abnormally high. COC Flash Point is marginally

high.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

05/01/22 05/24/22 0.3y 414 / 212 71.1 23.9    0.71 0.729 724 / 385 779 / 415 822 / 439 0.31 

10/14/21 10/28/21 22.0y 388 / 198 348.6 54.0    4.58 5.92 653 / 345 715 / 380 839 / 449 3.63 

09/18/21 11/02/21 0.1y FILTER NO 8 374 / 190 479.9 80.5    12.6 3.73 651 / 344 702 / 372 785 / 419 4.46 

09/14/21 11/02/21 22.0y FILTER NO 8 399 / 204 294.1 1381    7.75 7.21 655 / 346 716 / 380 854 / 457 3.96 

02/18/21 02/26/21 21.0y Return 374 / 190 65881.1 161     13.5 9.88 602 / 317 698 / 370 802 / 428 13.30

Baseline Data 349 / 176 19.0 0.03 655 / 346 790 / 421 3.40 

Report ID: [02490270] (Generated: 05/27/2022 14:04:26)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2022 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

9.2

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

05/01/22 313 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 6 1

10/14/21 2486 4 0 0 3 0 0 0 0 0 3 0 0 0 0 0 6 0 2 0 2 0 54 8

09/18/21 5032 9 1 1 4 0 0 0 0 0 4 0 1 0 0 0 12 0 4 0 4 0 0 16

09/14/21 2051 4 0 0 2 0 0 0 0 0 2 0 0 0 0 0 5 0 2 0 2 0 50 6

02/18/21 1883 2 0 0 2 0 0 0 0 0 3 1 2 0 0 0 8 0 6 0 4 0 0 6

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

10/14/21

This is not a Petro-Canada Lubricants product, however, as can clearly be seen there needs to be an immediate fluid change, part of which must be a clean and flush. Acidity is extremely high, as is the water content, viscosity and insoluble matter. There

is also visible debris which clearly shows a breakdown in the system. As part of the change there needs to be an investigation into what has happened to prevent recurrence. It also provides opportunity to move to a product such as CALFLO AF, but in

order to best recommend a Petro-Canada product we would need system conditions. In summary, you must do an oil change including clean and flush. Replace with Petro-Canada CALFLO product, and investigate the source of the water and the metal

debris in the oilIron ppm levels are severe. PQ levels are severe. Water contamination levels are severely high. Water contamination levels are severely high.. ppm Water contamination levels are severely high. Pentane Insolubles levels are severely high.

Acid Number (AN) is severely high. Visc @ 40°C is severely high. (GCD) % < 335°C is marginally high.

09/18/21

This is not a Petro-Canada Lubricants product, however, as can clearly be seen there needs to be an immediate fluid change, part of which must be a clean and flush. Acidity is extremely high, as is the water content, viscosity and insoluble

matter. There is also visible debris which clearly shows a breakdown in the system. As part of the change there needs to be an investigation into what has happened to prevent recurrence. It also provides opportunity to move to a product such as

CALFLO AF, but in order to best recommend a Petro-Canada product we would need system conditions. In summary, you must do an oil change including clean and flush. Replace with Petro-Canada CALFLO product, and investigate the source

of the water and the metal debris in the oilIron ppm levels are severe. PQ levels are severe. Water contamination levels are high. Pentane Insolubles levels are severely high. Acid Number (AN) is severely high. Visc @ 40°C is severely high.

09/14/21

This is not a Petro-Canada Lubricants product, however, as can clearly be seen there needs to be an immediate fluid change, part of which must be a clean and flush. Acidity is extremely high, as is the water content, viscosity and insoluble matter. There

is also visible debris which clearly shows a breakdown in the system. As part of the change there needs to be an investigation into what has happened to prevent recurrence. It also provides opportunity to move to a product such as CALFLO AF, but in

order to best recommend a Petro-Canada product we would need system conditions. In summary, you must do an oil change including clean and flush. Replace with Petro-Canada CALFLO product, and investigate the source of the water and the metal

debris in the oilIron ppm levels are severe. PQ levels are severe. Water contamination levels are severely high. Water contamination levels are severely high.. ppm Water contamination levels are severely high. Pentane Insolubles levels are severely high.

Acid Number (AN) is severely high. Visc @ 40°C is severely high. (GCD) % < 335°C is marginally high.

02/18/21

This is not a Petro-Canada Lubricants product, however, as can clearly be seen there needs to be an immediate fluid change, part of which must be a clean and flush. Acidity is extremely high, as is the water content, viscosity and insoluble matter. There

is also visible debris which clearly shows a breakdown in the system. As part of the change there needs to be an investigation into what has happened to prevent recurrence. It also provides opportunity to move to a product such as CALFLO AF, but in

order to best recommend a Petro-Canada product we would need system conditions. In summary, you must do an oil change including clean and flush. Replace with Petro-Canada CALFLO product, and investigate the source of the water and the metal

debris in the oilIron ppm levels are severe. PQ levels are severe. Water contamination levels are severely high. Water contamination levels are severely high.. ppm Water contamination levels are severely high. Pentane Insolubles levels are severely high.

Acid Number (AN) is severely high. Visc @ 40°C is severely high. (GCD) % < 335°C is marginally high.

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02490270] (Generated: 05/27/2022 14:04:26)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2022 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

