
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.8

HEATTRANSFER

Customer: PTRHTF20215 System Information Sample Information

McAsphalt Industries LTD

600 Arcola Ave

Regina, SK S4N 0S5 Canada

Attn: Joe Nurkowsky

Tel: (306)781-6960

E-Mail: jnurkowski@mcasphalt.com         

                                                                  

System Volume: 15000 ltr

Bulk Operating Temp: 338F / 170C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02510959

Analyst: Behshad Sabah 

Sample Date: 09/13/22

Received Date: 09/15/22

Completed: 09/21/22

Behshad Sabah

behshad.sabah@HFSinclair.com

Fluid: PETRO CANADA PETRO-THERM

Make: HEATEC

Recommendation: 

Comments: (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is marginally high. in total the oil is in good shape. please take another sample next year

to monitor.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

09/13/22 09/15/22 3.0y system supply header 446 / 230 21.8 34.7    0.13 0.056 738 / 392 825 / 441 922 / 494 0.95 

07/18/19 07/23/19 8.0y SYSTEM LINE 421 / 216 61.0 44.3    1.60 1.82 697 / 369 784 / 418 875 / 468 0.03 

Baseline Data 433 / 223 34.2 0.03 720 / 382 817 / 436 900 / 482 1.00 

Report ID: [02510959] (Generated: 09/21/2022 08:34:57)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2022 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.8

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

09/13/22 8 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 2 0 0 0

07/18/19 202 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 11 41 0 0 0 4 0 0 0 1 0 2 2

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

07/18/19

The current fluid Therm Oil 32 has extremely high Acid Number and Viscosity comparing with the fresh fluid indicating the oil has been oxidized and creating the tremendous solids and deposits

in the system. The heat transfer coefficient is reduced because of the oil oxidation and deposits. Please arrange the fluid change as soon as possible. A system inspection is also recommended

to determine if a system cleaning or flushing is needed.Iron ppm levels are abnormal. Potassium ppm levels are severely high. Solid levels are severely high. Visc @ 40°C is high.

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02510959] (Generated: 09/21/2022 08:34:57)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2022 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

