
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

5.6

[11-21-55-20W5M] H-802

Customer: PTRHTF20228 System Information Sample Information

PEYTO EXPLORATION

Box 7198

EDSON, AB T7E 1V4 Canada

Attn: Logan Pillage

Tel: (780)712-9444

E-Mail: Lpillage@Peyto.com                     

                                                                  

System Volume: 27000 ltr

Bulk Operating Temp: 370F / 188C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02516974

Analyst: Clinton Buhler 

Sample Date: 10/13/22

Received Date: 10/18/22

Completed: 10/20/22

Clinton Buhler

Clinton.Buhler@HFSinclair.com

Fluid: PETRO CANADA PETRO-THERM

Make: ALCO

Recommendation: Sample results show that the fluid remains fairly similar to the last couple analysis'. Long term, system will

require cleaning and fluid replacement. Please ensure blanket gas stays active in expansion tank. Please consider sweetening of

system to negate elevated Acid Number.Please re-sample in 6 months.

Comments: 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

10/13/22 10/18/22 0.0y DISCHARGE PUMP SIDE 451 / 233 39.6 56.9    0.81 1.29 745 / 396 838 / 448 899 / 482 0.46 

05/18/22 05/24/22 0.0y 450 / 232 15.7 55.5    0.80 1.24 742 / 395 836 / 447 899 / 482 0.75 

11/09/21 11/12/21 0.0y Discharge of pump 457 / 236 21.0 57.9    0.39 1.04 742 / 394 838 / 448 900 / 482 1.35 

07/28/21 08/04/21 0.0y DISCHARGE OF PUMP 478 / 248 31.9 56.7    0.84 2.08 744 / 396 838 / 448 898 / 481 0.91 

12/08/20 12/11/20 0.0y discharge of pump 453 / 234 18.9 60.0    0.64 1.33 744 / 396 839 / 448 899 / 482 0.69 

Baseline Data 433 / 223 34.2 0.03 720 / 382 817 / 436 900 / 482 1.00 

Report ID: [02516974] (Generated: 10/20/2022 18:24:13)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2022 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

5.6

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

10/13/22 61 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 2 4 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 1 0 0 0

05/18/22 64 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 2 4 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 1 0 0 0

11/09/21 66 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 2 4 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 1 0 0 0

07/28/21 67 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 2 4 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 1 0 0 0

12/08/20 65 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 2 4 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 1 0 0 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

05/18/22

Although not in ideal condition, the fluid parameters are similar  to the sample taken 6 months prior. Of concern is the elevated fluid viscosity, acid number and

solids content. Long term, the system will require cleaning and fluid replacement during a planned outage. With Acid Number at 0.8, it is advised to sweeten the

system to mitigate corrosion. Please re-sample in 6 months

11/09/21

Fluid condition, although not ideal, appears to be somewhat stable with regards to fluid oxidation; Acid Number is slightly less than last sample and Solids content

has reduced. Please continue filtering of solids and ensure that blanket gas is functional in the expansion tank. Eventually the fluid may require replacement,

depending on the future rate of degradation and solids formation.Please re-sample in 6 months

07/28/21

TAN, Viscosity and Pentane insolubles are severely high indicating oxidation of the fluid . Ensure gas blanket is functioning. Considering filtering out solids.

Pentane Insolubles levels are severely high. Acid Number (AN) is severely high. Visc @ 40°C is severely high.

12/08/20

TAN, Viscosity and Pentane insolubles are severely high indicating oxidation of the fluid . Ensure gas blanket is functioning. Considering filtering out solids.

Pentane Insolubles levels are severely high. Acid Number (AN) is severely high. Visc @ 40°C is severely high.

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02516974] (Generated: 10/20/2022 18:24:13)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2022 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

