
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

3.6

[16-2-20-01W4] PEMBINA PIPELINE CORP

Customer: PTRHTF20152 System Information Sample Information

PEMBINA NGL CORPORATION

P.O. BOX 640

MEDICINE HAT, AB T1A 7G6 Canada

Attn: Doug Gillingham

Tel: (403)838-7379

E-Mail: dgillingham@pembina.com          

                                                                  

System Volume: 10000 ltr

Bulk Operating Temp: 343F / 173C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02527991

Analyst: Lyle Dach 

Sample Date: 12/01/22

Received Date: 12/09/22

Completed: 12/21/22

Lyle Dach

lyle.dach@HFSinclair.com

Fluid: PETRO CANADA PETRO-THERM

Make: 

Recommendation: *** NOTE: Too much water present (>10% free water) in sample to conduct SimDist (GCD) analysis ***Free

water concentration is very high, continue draining water and venting steam to get water levels to acceptable levels. All other

available parameters appear to be at acceptable levels. Resample once free water is no longer visible in the samples.

Comments: 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

12/01/22 12/09/22 1.0y 475 / 246 155.5 33.8    0.06 0.037

04/29/19 05/13/19 15.0y FILTER UPSTREAM 444 / 229 1.0 41.1    0.016 0.041 731 / 388 841 / 449 968 / 520 0.00 

01/15/15 01/22/15 10.0y AFTER FILTER 442 / 228 1.6 41.2    0.03 0.029 704 / 373 809 / 432 933 / 500 0.83 

Baseline Data 433 / 223 34.2 0.03 720 / 382 817 / 436 900 / 482 1.00 

Report ID: [02527991] (Generated: 12/21/2022 16:35:09)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2022 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

3.6

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

12/01/22 5 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 2 0 0 0 0 0

04/29/19 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

01/15/15 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

04/29/19

Fluid is in very good condition.  The viscosity and GCD 90% distillation points are higher than new Petro-Therm.  If this fluid is in fact 15 years old that is normal. 

Petro-Therm prior to 2006 was a higher viscosity fluid.

01/15/15

Viscosity showing slight increase.  In general the fluid is in good condition.  Resample in 6 months to begin establishing trend.  Be sure to us Customer #

PTRHTF20152 to ensure future samples get linked up with prior history.  (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is abnormally high.

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02527991] (Generated: 12/21/2022 16:35:09)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2022 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

GCD Spectrum

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

