
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

5.2

GCP APPLIED TECH - USED

Customer: PTRHTF10264 System Information Sample Information

GCP APPLIED TECHNOLOGIES

350 MAGNOLIA DR

MOUNT PLEASANT, TN 38474 USA

Attn: Lee Skelton

Tel: (931)379-1859

E-Mail: austin.l.skelton@gcpat.com          

                                                                  

System Volume: 2100 gal

Bulk Operating Temp: 370F / 188C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02539372

Analyst: Jake Finn 

Sample Date: 02/06/23

Received Date: 02/14/23

Completed: 03/24/23

Jake Finn

jake.finn@HFSinclair.com

Fluid: DUBOIS PERCHEM 1562

Make: HEATEC

Recommendation: Calcium levels are very high, possible contamination in system or abnormal results may be due to sampling

procedure.  Discussions to follow with customer to investigate potential contamination sources and next steps.

Comments: Pentane Insolubles levels are severely high. Calcium ppm levels are severely high. (GCD) 10% Distillation Point is

marginally high. (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is marginally high.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

02/06/23 02/14/23 4.0y 399 / 204 53.8 22.2    0.22 0.961 671 / 355 768 / 409 863 / 461 4.00 

Baseline Data 383 / 195 21.7 0.01 631 / 333 765 / 407 842 / 450 10   

Report ID: [02539372] (Generated: 03/24/2023 16:39:23)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2023 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

5.2

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

02/06/23 2 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 15 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 153 0 0 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

 

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02539372] (Generated: 03/24/2023 16:39:23)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2023 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

