
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

POWDER SLUSH HOT OIL

Customer: PTRHTF30023 System Information Sample Information

INOAC INTERIOR SYSTEMS

575 JAMES STREET SOUTH

ST MARYS, ON N4X 1B9 CA

Attn: Brent Dietrich

Tel: (519)808-0372

E-Mail: bdietrich@inoacusa.com

System Volume: 14000 ltr

Bulk Operating Temp: 500F / 260C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02568914

Analyst: Yen Garcia 

Sample Date: 07/07/23

Received Date: 07/10/23

Completed: 08/09/23

Yen Garcia

yen.garcia@HFSinclair.com

Fluid: PETRO CANADA CALFLO LT

Make: BP&R CONSTRUCTION

Recommendation: The fluid remains within optimal parameters and the tests results are similar to the previous one. No further

actions are required at this time.

Comments: 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

07/07/23 07/10/23 0.0h RETURN 327 / 164 27.7 7.6     0.16 0.043 605 / 319 636 / 336 745 / 396 47.81

12/23/22 01/05/23 0.0h HOT OIL RETURN 327 / 164 13.5 7       0.17 0.054 609 / 321 638 / 337 742 / 394 45.04

08/02/22 08/08/22 0.0h 345 / 174 26.1 7.1     0.14 0.318 607 / 320 636 / 335 739 / 393 48.11

12/24/21 01/07/22 0.0h 334 / 168 7.5 7.1     0.16 0.027 606 / 319 636 / 336 739 / 393 48.57

07/22/21 07/23/21 0.0h 342 / 172 19.9 7.1     0.15 0.102 606 / 319 635 / 335 736 / 391 49.69

Baseline Data 349 / 176 7.52 0.1  604 / 318 640 / 338 734 / 390 47.0 

Report ID: [02568914] (Generated: 08/09/2023 10:58:42)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2023 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

07/07/23 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 100 1

12/23/22 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 101 0

08/02/22 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 93 0

12/24/21 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 100 0

07/22/21 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 106 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 270

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

12/23/22

All sample test results are within specs. Please, keep monitoring.

08/02/22

No action needed at this time.

12/24/21

Sample results indicate that the fluid is suitable for continue use. Please, sample at the next appropriate interval (6 to 9 months). No action needed at this time.

07/22/21

Current heat transfer fluid Calflo LT sample for the Hot Oil system indicates no issues.  All performance parameters such as Viscosity, Total Acid Number (TAN),

Flash Point, GCD, and Pentane Insolubles are typical for a heat transfer fluid in service.  Calflo LT is suitable for continued service.  Resample at the next interval

(6 - 9 months).

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02568914] (Generated: 08/09/2023 10:58:42)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2023 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

