
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

2.0

IVAN MACIEL

Customer: PTRHTF60039 System Information Sample Information

NOVONIX Anode Materials

353 Corporate Place

Chattonooga, TN 37419 US

Attn: Ivan Maciel

Tel: (423)903-5884

E-Mail: ivan.maciel@novonixgroup.com

System Volume: 30 ltr

Bulk Operating Temp: 392F / 200C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02572806

Analyst: Jake Finn 

Sample Date: 07/13/23

Received Date: 07/27/23

Completed: 07/31/23

Jake Finn

jake.finn@HFSinclair.com

Fluid: PETRO CANADA CALFLO AF

Make: USALAB

Recommendation: Overall, sample is in great condition despite the dark color.  Acid number was flagged just above the warning level, but

Acid Number is best considered over time as a rate of change/trend instead of individual data points. GCD 90% distillation point was also

flagged as marginally high but this value is not concerning when considering the other GCD values.Some very lite debris is noted by the

lab which is not abnormal. No other concerning signs of degradation, wear or contamination. COC flash point is strong at 226°C.  Test

results indicate that the current fluid is suitable for continued use, but can be changed out when convenient within the next year if desired.

Comments: Acid Number (AN) is abnormally high. (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is marginally high.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

07/13/23 07/27/23 3.0h 439 / 226 13.5 32.3    0.34 0.165 703 / 373 800 / 427 910 / 488 1.28 

Baseline Data 435 / 224 32.7 0.03 693 / 367 790 / 421 887 / 475 2.5  

Report ID: [02572806] (Generated: 08/01/2023 12:27:21)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2023 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

2.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

07/13/23 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 3 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 291 2

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 270

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

 

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02572806] (Generated: 08/01/2023 12:27:21)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2023 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

