
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

HOT OIL

Customer: PTRHTF10002 System Information Sample Information

EVONIK

3305  26th ST

LOS ANGELES, CA  US

Attn: Prakash Mehta

Tel: (818)709-0492

E-Mail: purelubricants@earthlink.net

System Volume: 1500 gal

Bulk Operating Temp: 600F / 316C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02584243

Analyst: Carlos Nazario 

Sample Date: 09/11/23

Received Date: 09/20/23

Completed: 09/27/23

Carlos Nazario

Carlos.Nazario@hfsinclair.com

Fluid: PETRO CANADA CALFLO HTF

Make: 

Recommendation: Kinematic viscosity and Flash point low; may indicate a thermal degradation of the heat transfer fluid. Check

the gas blanket pressure, if it is high, try to vent the expansion tank till the pressure is to predetermined set. Sweet the system at

25% and resample in 3 month for follow up.

Comments: COC Flash Point is severely low. Visc @ 40°C is abnormally low.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

09/11/23 09/20/23 0.0y 334 / 168 17.8 24.9    0.03 0.054 665 / 351 801 / 427 904 / 484 7.57 

02/06/23 02/23/23 1.0y bottom coil 327 / 164 2.7 26.4    0.06 0.040 675 / 357 804 / 429 907 / 486 6.67 

09/23/22 10/11/22 1.0y 331 / 166 13.3 26.3    0.05 0.318 683 / 362 804 / 429 906 / 486 6.05 

02/03/22 02/03/22 0.0y 370 / 188 102.0 26.2    0.05 0.060 674 / 357 804 / 429 908 / 487 6.78 

10/18/21 10/28/21 0.0y 345 / 174 16.5 24.7    0.03 0.163 658 / 348 800 / 427 909 / 487 8.10 

Baseline Data 448 / 231 35.20 .1   712 / 378 810 / 432 910 / 488 1.75 

Report ID: [02584243] (Generated: 09/27/2023 17:41:42)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2023 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

09/11/23 24 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 33 1

02/06/23 4 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 18 0

09/23/22 3 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 19 0

02/03/22 14 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 33 0

10/18/21 4 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 17 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 280

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

02/06/23

COC Flash Point is severely low. Visc @ 40°C is abnormally low.

09/23/22

The Flash Point is very low and the viscosity is low.  It indicates lighter fractions being boiled off. I would suggest a resample and make sure plenty of oil is purged

out before taking sample.  COC Flash Point is severely low. Visc @ 40°C is abnormally low.

02/03/22

Sample appears normal except for COC Flash Point is marginally low.  Add a small amount of new oil to raise flash point.    COC Flash Point is marginally low.

10/18/21

The oil typicals have returned to somewhat normal compared to the previous sample.  Pentane insolubles indicate some contamination.  Water content dropped

significantly.  Adding a small amount of new oil could improve the typicals significantly.  COC Flash Point is abnormally low. (GCD) % < 335°C is marginally high.

(GCD) 10% Distillation Point is marginally low.

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02584243] (Generated: 09/27/2023 17:41:42)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2023 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

