
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.8

PHASE 1 HOT OIL

Customer: PTRHTF20253 System Information Sample Information

Plains Midstream Canada

LCD 1 SOUTH

PO BOX 1150

EMPRESS, AB T0J 1E0 CA

Attn: Sandeep Sekhon

Tel: 

E-Mail:

System Volume: 0 gal

Bulk Operating Temp: Not Specified

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02621856

Analyst: Lyle Dach 

Sample Date: 03/04/24

Received Date: 03/13/24

Completed: 03/19/24

Lyle Dach

lyle.dach@HFSinclair.com

Fluid: ESSO OIL 1156

Make: 

Recommendation: Fluid looks to be acceptable condition for continued use, being a mixture of fluid some of the specs will be

slightly off. Water content, acid number, and pentane insolubles are all low. The sample is trending flat and results are very

similar to the last sample.

Comments: COC Flash Point is abnormally high.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

03/04/24 03/13/24 52.0y 295 / 146 47 4       0.14 0.292 451 / 233 528 / 276 766 / 408 81.04

05/10/21 05/13/21 0.0y Phase 1 284 / 140 40.2 3.6     0.16 0.177 451 / 233 525 / 274 765 / 407 81.77

Baseline Data 212 / 100 3.1       

Report ID: [02621856] (Generated: 03/19/2024 16:49:08)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2024 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.8

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

03/04/24 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

05/10/21 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

05/10/21

Fluid condition shows no sign of contamination, thermal degradation or oxidation therefore suitable for continued use.  COC Flash Point is abnormally high, likely

due to the partial charge of Thermoil 32 / Petro-Therm.   Same applies to the slight increase in viscosity.

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02621856] (Generated: 03/19/2024 16:49:08)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2024 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

