
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

1.2

[4-21-76-9W6] HEAT TRANSFER

Customer: PTRHTF20204 System Information Sample Information

ADVANTAGE OIL AND GAS

HYTHE, AB  CA

Attn: Sovke Rathamore

Tel: (780)518-9978

E-Mail: srathamore@advantageog.com

System Volume: 20000 ltr

Bulk Operating Temp: 419F / 215C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02624514

Analyst: Clinton Buhler 

Sample Date: 03/18/24

Received Date: 03/25/24

Completed: 04/02/24

Clinton Buhler

Clinton.Buhler@HFSinclair.com

Fluid: PETRO CANADA PETRO-THERM

Make: 

Recommendation: Sample results show that the fluid viscosity, flash point and 10% GCD temperature are lower than expected for fresh

Petro-Therm. That, along with 6.7% low boiling vapor content suggest that there has either been some cross contamination with

process fluids or the expansion tank blanket gas pressure is set too high- both of which can impact these parameters. If possible,

please lower blanket gas pressure (2-3 psi is ideal if pump NPSH allows). Vent expansion tank of low boiling vapors on a regular basis

and then re-sample in 3 months time but only re-sample after venting has been performed and blanket gas pressure has been reduced.

Comments: COC Flash Point is abnormally low. Visc @ 40°C is abnormally low.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

03/18/24 03/25/24 1.0y PUMP DISCHARGE 338 / 170 31 28.5    0.02 0.053 683 / 362 795 / 424 896 / 480 6.70 

Baseline Data 433 / 223 34.2 0.03 720 / 382 817 / 436 900 / 482 1.00 

Report ID: [02624514] (Generated: 04/02/2024 12:49:36)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2024 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

1.2

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

03/18/24 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 2 0 0 0 0 1

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

 

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02624514] (Generated: 04/02/2024 12:49:36)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2024 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

