
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

3.2

211-001

Customer: PTRHTF60067 System Information Sample Information

Glenn O Hawbaker Inc.

165 Bedrock Ln.

Bellefonte, PA 16823 US

Attn: Ryan Fisher

Tel: (814)574-3984

E-Mail: srs@goh-inc.com

System Volume: 500 gal

Bulk Operating Temp: 380F / 193C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02626807

Analyst: Greg Fernandez 

Sample Date: 03/22/24

Received Date: 04/04/24

Completed: 04/16/24

Greg Fernandez

gregory.fernandez@hfsinclair.com

Fluid: MULTITHERM IG-4

Make: AMERICAN HEATER

Recommendation: The sample submitted appears to be in generally good condition with no indications of contaminants or abnormal

degradation. The fluid appears to be typical of an in-service fluid with some marginally elevated parameters that merit continued monitoring.

As with other GOH samples, Calcium is high, likely due to airborne limestone in the localized environment.For future sampling and trending

purposes, it is important to record system parameters such as Unit Age, Time on Oil, Fluid name/type if known, etc. when submitting samples.

Comments: Water contamination levels are marginally high. ppm Water contamination levels are marginally high. Calcium ppm levels are

abnormally high. Visc @ 40°C is abnormally low. (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is marginally low.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

03/22/24 04/04/24 0.0y #3 tank hose 432 / 222 387 32.2    0.20 0.107 708 / 376 813 / 434 914 / 490 0.80 

Baseline Data 441 / 227 44.0      725 / 385 820 / 438 936 / 502 5.7  

Report ID: [02626807] (Generated: 04/16/2024 08:06:26)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2024 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

3.2

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

03/22/24 15 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 8 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 34 0 2 3

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

 

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02626807] (Generated: 04/16/2024 08:06:26)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2024 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

