
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.8

[Leland / 14-23-58-26W45] H-3700/H-3750

Customer: PTRHTF20273 System Information Sample Information

CANADIAN NATURAL RESOURCES

(CNRL)

Smoky/Leland/Bistone

EDSON, AB T7E 1L5 CA

Attn: Rodney Marcichiw

Tel: 

E-Mail: rodney.marcichiw@cnrl.com

System Volume: 10000 ltr

Bulk Operating Temp: 365F / 185C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02626808

Analyst: Clinton Buhler 

Sample Date: 03/26/24

Received Date: 04/04/24

Completed: 04/15/24

Clinton Buhler

Clinton.Buhler@HFSinclair.com

Fluid: PETRO CANADA PETRO-THERM

Make: PETRO TECH HEATERS

Recommendation: Sample results indicate that the fluid is in suitable condition for continued service. Flash point is marginally low,

but consistent with last year's sample. Consider periodic venting of the expansion tank to help improve flash point. Please re-

sample in 12 months.

Comments: 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

03/26/24 04/04/24 0.0y P37750 PUMP SEAL 379 / 193 37 29.5    0.01 0.035 719 / 382 815 / 435 911 / 488 2.47 

04/24/23 05/09/23 0.0y 381 / 194 29.8 29.7    0.08 0.044 717 / 380 814 / 434 909 / 487 2.82 

10/20/20 10/28/20 11.0y Pump discharge 266 / 130 36.6 28.4    0.01 0.092 713 / 378 811 / 433 900 / 482 3.46 

03/25/20 04/02/20 0.0y PUMP DISCHARGE 187 / 86 31.1 28.3    0.02 0.118 719 / 382 815 / 435 907 / 486 2.39 

01/30/20 02/06/20 0.0y PUMP SEAL 248 / 120 25.7 28.2    0.029 0.057 736 / 391 808 / 431 888 / 475 8.28 

Baseline Data 433 / 223 34.2 0.03 720 / 382 817 / 436 900 / 482 1.00 

Report ID: [02626808] (Generated: 04/15/2024 16:46:08)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2024 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.8

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

03/26/24 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

04/24/23 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

10/20/20 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

03/25/20 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

01/30/20 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

04/24/23

Sample results indicate the fluid is in suitable condition for continued service. The fluid's flash point has improved since the last sample in 2020. Please re-sample

in 12 months.

10/20/20

Sample results indicate that the fluid is suitable for continues service. Please note that the fluid's flash point has improved since the previous sample, yet the low

boiling vapor content has increased. The flash point is still low. It is advised to continue regular venting of low boiling vapors to improve the fluids flash point.Re-

sample in 6 months once venting regime has been initiated.

03/25/20

This is the re-run of the sample taken on March 25th when a low boiler vapor content of  15.8% was reported due to a GC fault. After GC repair the low boiler

vapor content is 2.39%. The other parameters remain the same. The fluid is in a reasonable condition and suitable for further use. Venting is still important to try

and increase the Flash Point of the fluid.  COC Flash Point is severely low.

01/30/20

The fluid is in reasonable condition and suitable for further use. Viscosity is slightly low. Flash Point is very low. This is the result of a low boiler vapor content of 8.28% which is

considered high. A Flash Point below 150 degrees C is a safety concern and the low boiler vapor content at this level may result in pump cavitation, flow problems or pump seal

leakage. Venting of low boiler vapor to atmosphere is recommended. Please re-sample in 6 months.  COC Flash Point is severely low. (GCD) % < 335°C is marginally high.

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02626808] (Generated: 04/15/2024 16:46:08)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2024 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

