
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

4.4

B17R33/PM17-76

Customer: PTRHTF10011 System Information Sample Information

G.F.S. CHEMICAL

851 Mckinley Avenue

COLUMBUS, OH 43222 US

Attn: Jamie Walters

Tel: (800)446-4910

E-Mail: jamie@gfschemicals.com

System Volume: 50 gal

Bulk Operating Temp: 400F / 204C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02635907

Analyst: Joe Goecke 

Sample Date: 04/02/24

Received Date: 05/15/24

Completed: 06/04/24

Joe Goecke

Joe.goecke@HFSinclair.com

Fluid: EASTMAN THERMINOL 59

Make: 

Recommendation: Sample appears to be out of specification for this product.  However it is identified as Therminol 59.  I would

suggest changing this product based on the data provided.

Comments: (GCD) % < 335°C is severely high. Visc @ 40°C is abnormally high.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

04/02/24 05/15/24 14.0y 302 / 150 89 4.7     0.03 0.024 515 / 269 565 / 296 639 / 337 88.81

12/20/16 12/20/16 0.0y 306 / 152 25.3 4.2     0.046 0.014 507 / 264 562 / 295 663 / 351 86.11

03/18/13 03/28/13 0.0y RECIRC LINE 417 / 214 28.1 20.0    0.031 0.157 675 / 357 763 / 406 837 / 447 2.91 

Baseline Data 295 / 146 4.0  0.03 525 / 274 635 / 335 63.00

Report ID: [02635907] (Generated: 06/04/2024 11:20:07)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2024 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

4.4

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

04/02/24 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 18 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 2 0

12/20/16 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 8 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

03/18/13 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 3 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

12/20/16

(GCD) % < 335°C is abnormally high. (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is abnormally high. Viscosity and Flash point appear normal. Suggest resampling at 1/2

normal cycle due to high Light ends, suitable for continued use  (GCD) % < 335°C is abnormally high. (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is abnormally high.

03/18/13

The oil condition appears to be good at this time.  (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is marginally low.

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02635907] (Generated: 06/04/2024 11:20:07)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2024 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

