
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

6.4

[CONSTRUCTORA HERRERA SA] CONSTRUCTORA HERRERA

Customer: PTRHTF60023 System Information Sample Information

INDUSTRIAS del PETROLEO CANAD.

SA

Contiguo FANAL

frente a la Autopista Bernardo Soto

Grecia, A  CR

Attn: María Fernanda Matamoros

Rodríguez

System Volume: 1230 ltr

Bulk Operating Temp: 464F / 240C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02638721

Analyst: Peter Harteveld 

Sample Date: 05/20/24

Received Date: 05/29/24

Completed: 06/07/24

Peter Harteveld

peter.harteveld@HFSinclair.com

Fluid: PETRO CANADA PETRO-THERM

Make: ARAUTERM

Recommendation: The fluid is not suitable for use and has to be replaced after cleaning of the system. High AN, viscosity, Pentane Insoluble (solids)

content and 90% GCD temperature all indicate the fluid experiences a high rate of oxidation considering the fluid has only been in service for 8 months. The

one parameter which doesn't correlate with AN specifically is Fe content. With AN at 4.69 the oil is acidic and corrosive. This should have resulted in a much

higher Fe number and raises the question where the sample has been taken from. Never take samples from drain lines, filter housing or from the expansion

tank. Best sample point is discharge side of the heat medium pump with the pump running. Please check proper operation of blanket gas system.

Comments: Pentane Insolubles levels are severely high. Acid Number (AN) is severely high. Visc @ 40°C is severely high. (GCD) 90% Distillation Point is

marginally high.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

05/20/24 05/29/24 8.0m MAIN DRAIN VALVE 457 / 236 301 79.0    4.69 11.9 727 / 386 818 / 437 925 / 496 2.43 

Baseline Data 433 / 223 34.2 0.03 720 / 382 817 / 436 900 / 482 1.00 

Report ID: [02638721] (Generated: 06/07/2024 15:40:12)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2024 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

6.4

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

05/20/24 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

 

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02638721] (Generated: 06/07/2024 15:40:12)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2024 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

