
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

CHEVRON MEROPA 220

Customer: System Information Sample Information

HEXION INC - LA GRANDE PLANT

62575 OR HWY

LA GRANDE, OR 97850 USA

Attn: STEVE HEINE

Tel: (541)963-7155

E-Mail: steve.heine@hexion.com;mike.jo

hnson@amrri.com                                    

System Volume: 0 gal

Bulk Operating Temp: 221F / 105C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 05093309

Analyst: Doug Bogart 

Sample Date: 09/30/20

Received Date: 10/16/20

Completed: 10/28/20

Doug Bogart

dougb@wearcheckusa.com

Fluid: CHEVRON MEROPA 220

Make: 

Recommendation: This is a baseline read-out on the submitted sample.

Comments: 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

09/30/20 10/16/20 0h 107.2 224.4   0.636

Baseline Data 473 / 245 209       

Report ID: [05093309] (Generated: 10/28/2020 19:20:14)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2020 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

09/30/20 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 5 0 2 4 0 42 0 3 0 272 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

 

 

 

 

 

Report ID: [05093309] (Generated: 10/28/2020 19:20:14)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2020 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

GCD Spectrum

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

