
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

N-4086

Customer: System Information Sample Information

LANXESS CORPORATION

2151 KING STREET EXT

CHARLESTON, SC 29405 USA

Attn: TIM OSBORNE

Tel: (843)740-5372

E-Mail: timothy.osborne@lanxess.com    

                                                                  

System Volume: 310 gal

Bulk Operating Temp: Not Specified

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 05372612

Analyst: Doug Bogart 

Sample Date: 10/07/21

Received Date: 10/12/21

Completed: 10/25/21

Doug Bogart

dougb@wearcheckusa.com

Fluid: ROYAL PURPLE HY-THERM 707

Make: 

Recommendation: We advise that you vent the lower-boilers and volatiles from the fluid holding tank. We recommend an early

resample to monitor this condition.  Diagnostician`s Note:  The low flash point increases the risk of a potential fire.  Test(s) for

GDC and Pentane insolubles performed at WearCheck Canada.

Comments: N/A The flash point is much lower than normal. The water content is negligible. The viscosity is lower than typical, the

viscosity is in ISO 15 range. The fluid is still serviceable provided that the contaminant(s) can be reduced to acceptable levels.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

10/07/21 10/12/21 0.0h 246 / 119 80 14.7    0.254 0.029 364 / 185 887 / 475 984 / 529 17.54

08/24/21 09/01/21 0.0h 212 / 100 72.7 15.1    0.050 364 / 185 890 / 477 991 / 533 17.75

Baseline Data 496 / 258 32.1      642 / 339 891 / 477 995 / 535 7.2  

Report ID: [05372612] (Generated: 01/03/2022 08:24:27)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2022 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

10/07/21 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 7 0

08/24/21 0 0 0 0 0 0 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 6 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

08/24/21

We advise that you vent the lower-boilers and volatiles from the fluid holding tank. We recommend an early resample to monitor this condition.  Diagnostician`s

Note:  The low flash point increases the risk of a potential fire. The flash point is much lower than normal. The water content is negligible. The viscosity is lower

than typical, the viscosity is in ISO 15 range. The fluid is still serviceable provided that the contaminant(s) can be reduced to acceptable levels.

 

 

 

 

Report ID: [05372612] (Generated: 01/03/2022 08:24:27)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2022 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

GCD Spectrum

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

