
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

2787 - 0803202001AB

Customer: System Information Sample Information

SAINT-GOBAIN PERFORMANCE

PLASTICS

701 DANIEL WEBSTER HWY

MERRIMACK, NH 03054 USA

Attn: NORMAN LACHANCE

Tel: (603)420-1494

E-Mail: norman.r.lachance@saint-

System Volume: 0 gal

Bulk Operating Temp: Not Specified

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 05601781

Analyst: Doug Bogart 

Sample Date: 06/01/22

Received Date: 07/27/22

Completed: 08/02/22

Doug Bogart

dougb@wearcheckusa.com

Fluid: MOBIL MOBILTHERM 603

Make: 

Recommendation: No corrective action is recommended at this time. Resample at the next service interval to monitor.

Comments: All component wear rates are normal. Moderate concentration of visible dirt/debris present in the fluid. The water

content is negligible. The AN level is acceptable for this fluid. The condition of the fluid is suitable for further service.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

06/01/22 07/27/22 0.0h 390 / 199 750 20.8    0.071

02/11/21 02/12/21 0.0h POSTPAID 415 / 213 2140 21.00   0.067

Baseline Data 379 / 193 20.2 0.03 

Report ID: [05601781] (Generated: 10/31/2022 14:43:33)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2022 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

06/01/22 6 0 0 0 0 0 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 12 0

02/11/21 20 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

02/11/21

This is a baseline read-out on the submitted sample. There is a light concentration of water present in the fluid. Moderate concentration of visible dirt/debris

present in the fluid. The AN level is acceptable for this fluid.

 

 

 

 

WearCheck Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability

whatsoever with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it.

Report ID: [05601781] (Generated: 10/31/2022 14:43:33)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2022 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

GCD Spectrum

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

