
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

8.0

BOUILLOIRE LA BAIE                                                                                  

Customer: PTRHTF30106 System Information Sample Information

SINTRA

4000 CHEMIN DES SABLES

SAGUENAY, QC G7N 1L7 Canada

Attn: Regis Milliard

Tel: 

E-Mail: rmilliard@sintra.ca                        

                                                                  

System Volume: 800 ltr  

Bulk Operating Temp: 350F / 177C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02179510

Analyst: Claude Bureau 

Sample Date: 10/26/17

Received Date: 11/02/17

Completed: 01/04/18

To discuss this report contact Claude

Bureau at (438)863-7577

Fluid: PETRO CANADA PETRO-THERM

Make: TECHNIFLAMME        

Recommendation: En raison de laugmentation de la viscosité et de la contaminions de lhuile celle-ci nest plus en bonne

condition dopération. Un nettoyage du system est fortement recommandé avant de recharger celui-ci avec de lhuile neuve.

SVP bien vérifier que la bonne huile est additionnée au system caloporteur.

Comments: Aucun métaux d`usures détectés. Les insolubles au pentanes sont élevées, le point déclair est légèrement plus

bas que la normale. La quantité de souffre (S : 2681 ppm) est largement au-dessus de la quantité normalement trouvé (S : 326

ppm max) dans lhuile neuve. La viscosité de lhuile est 40% plus élevée que la normale.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

10/26/17 11/02/17 5y DANS LE RESERVOIR 367 / 186 60.3 66.0    0.53 1.08 749 / 398 850 / 455 939 / 504 0.00 

Baseline Data 433 / 223 34.2 0.03 720 / 382 817 / 436 900 / 482 1.00 

Report ID: [02179510] (Generated: 01/04/2018 11:22:26)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2018 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

8.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

10/26/17 63 0 0 0 3 4 1 4 0 0 0 6 1 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 4 0 3 3

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

 

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02179510] (Generated: 01/04/2018 11:22:26)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2018 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

