
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

10.0

HUILE ST-NAZAIRE                                                                                    

Customer: PTRHTF30106 System Information Sample Information

SINTRA

4000 CHEMIN DES SABLES

SAGUENAY, QC G7N 1L7 Canada

Attn: Regis Milliard

Tel: 

E-Mail: rmilliard@sintra.ca                        

                                                                  

System Volume: 600 ltr  

Bulk Operating Temp: 380F / 193C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02180836

Analyst: Claude Bureau 

Sample Date: 10/24/17

Received Date: 11/07/17

Completed: 12/12/17

To discuss this report contact Claude

Bureau at (438)863-7577

Fluid: PETRO CANADA PETRO-THERM

Make: POWER FLAMME        

Recommendation: Veuillez noter que le fluide était trop épais pour permettre d`effectuer certains des tests habituels de

laboratoire.Le fluide nest plus en état dopération. SVP vidanger le système et nettoyer celui-ci.

Comments: Légère quantité de plomb détectée Les insolubles aux pentane sont très élevées. La quantité de souffre est très

élevée. L'acidité de l'huile est élevée par rapport à la valeur typique. Le fluide est oxypolymérisée et ne devrait plus servir.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

10/24/17 11/07/17 5y RESERVOIR BOUILLOIRE 132.6 >10000  2.00 8.32 

Baseline Data 433 / 223 34.2 0.03 720 / 382 817 / 436 900 / 482 1.00 

Report ID: [02180836] (Generated: 12/12/2017 11:05:28)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2017 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

10.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

10/24/17 34 0 0 0 3 24 0 0 0 0 1 18 0 0 0 0 0 4 1 0 0 0 1 12

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

 

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02180836] (Generated: 12/12/2017 11:05:28)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2017 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

