
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

2.0

[MONT LAURIER] USINE 048                                                                                           

Customer: PTRHTF30091 System Information Sample Information

PM Fabrication

17250 Cote St. Antoine

Mirabel, QC J7J 2G9 Canada

Attn: Guy Legault

Tel: (514)771-9546

E-Mail: glegault@pmrivenord.com            

                                                                  

System Volume: 1000 ltr  

Bulk Operating Temp: 350F / 177C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02186482

Analyst: Pierre Castagne 

Sample Date: 11/04/17

Received Date: 12/07/17

Completed: 12/15/17

To discuss this report contact Pierre

Castagne at 450-981-0693

Fluid: PETRO CANADA PETRO-THERM

Make:                     

Recommendation: Il y a trace de Bitume, la viscosité est hors norme. Reprendre un échantillon dans 6 mois.

Comments: 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

11/04/17 12/07/17 0y 432 / 222 22.0 49.0    0.323 0.204 740 / 394 835 / 446 915 / 491 0.00 

10/04/16 10/17/16 1y MELANGEUR 446 / 230 31.6 49.2    0.26 0.185 731 / 388 842 / 450 972 / 522 0.00 

Baseline Data 433 / 223 34.2 0.03 720 / 382 817 / 436 900 / 482 1.00 

Report ID: [02186482] (Generated: 12/15/2017 22:36:37)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2017 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

2.0

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

11/04/17 13 0 0 0 1 3 1 1 0 0 1 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 1 21

10/04/16 18 0 0 0 1 4 1 1 0 0 1 2 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 2 28

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

10/04/16

On constate la présence de fractions Lourdes (GCD @90°C), les fractions lourdes favorisent les dépôts de carbone ainsi quune augmentation de la viscosité.On

constate une trace dasphalte (Vanadium) dans léchantillon. Il y a des additifs dans léchantillon qui ne font pas partie des additifs typiques à un fluide caloporteur.

Vérifier que vous utilisez des pompes de transfert dédier  uniquement au fluide caloporteur.

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02186482] (Generated: 12/15/2017 22:36:37)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2017 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

