
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.407-330                                                                                              
Customer: PTRHTF30100 System Information Sample Information

FOREX INC.

301 RUE DE L`HARRICANA

AMOS, QC J9T 3A6 Canada

Attn: Carl Millaire

Tel: 819321660

E-Mail: c.millaire@forexinc.ca                  

                                                                  

System Volume: 128000 ltr  

Bulk Operating Temp: 489F / 254C

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02207998

Analyst: Claude Bureau 

Sample Date: 03/28/18

Received Date: 04/03/18

Completed: 04/16/18

To discuss this report contact Claude

Bureau at (438)863-7577

Fluid: PETRO CANADA PETRO-THERM

Make: GTS ENERGY          

Recommendation: Il serait bien de déterminer la provenance du calcium dans le system. Provient probablement du produit

abas poussière utilisé à l’entour de l’usine. L’huile est en condition d’opération, ré-échantillonner au même intervalle afin de

bien suivre l’évolution de l’huile.

Comments: Aucune trace d’usure détecté. Présence de calcium détectée (Ca à 30PPM). Le calcium semble être en

décroissance par rapport à l’l’analyse du 14 Février 2017. L’huile est en condition d’opération.

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

03/28/18 04/03/18 7d 466 / 241 56.7 30.4    0.02 0.059 774 / 412 919 / 493 1031 / 555 0.11 

02/14/17 02/21/17 33d CENTRALE THERMIQUE 466 / 241 16.0 91.9    0.108 0.091 794 / 423 930 / 499 1030 / 555 0.48 

Baseline Data 433 / 223 34.2 0.03 720 / 382 817 / 436 900 / 482 1.00 

Report ID: [02207998] (Generated: 04/16/2018 06:59:56)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2018 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

0.4

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

03/28/18 137 1 0 0 1 0 0 30 0 0 3 2 0 0 0 0 1 0 1 1 30 1 2 2

02/14/17 129 1 0 0 0 0 0 42 0 0 4 4 1 0 0 0 2 0 0 1 42 2 2 3

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

02/14/17

On note quelques particules métalliques (Fe, Na, S) présentes dans l'échantillon. Nous recommandons de filtrer l'huile à  5 microns pour éliminer tout

contaminant métallique. Tous les autres paramètres sont normaux.L'huile est en bon état et peut demeurer en service jusqu'au prochain échantillonnage. Nous

recommandons un nouvel échantillon dans 12 mois.

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02207998] (Generated: 04/16/2018 06:59:56)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2018 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

