
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

6.4

HUILE THERMIQUE

Customer: PTRHTF30160 System Information Sample Information

BETON PROVINCIAL LTEE.

C.P. 160-1825 DE PHARE OUEST

MATANE, QC G4W 3N1 Canada

Attn: Frederic Noel

Tel: (418)580-9385

E-Mail: f.noel@betonprovincial.com         

                                                                  

System Volume: 0 gal

Bulk Operating Temp: Not Specified

Heating Source: 

Blanket: 

Lab No: 02385534

Analyst: Pierre Castagne 

Sample Date: 10/27/20

Received Date: 11/05/20

Completed: 11/12/20

Pierre Castagne

pierre.castagne@petrocanadalsp.com

Fluid: HEAT TRANSFER FLUID ISO 46

Make: 

Recommendation: La teneur en acide est très élevée Acid Number (AN) 2.11. La teneur en eau est élevée (ppm Water) 903.0. La

viscosité de l'huile a augmenté de ISO VG 46 à 56.4.Les fractions lourdes (GCD @ 90%) sont élevés. Les solides (Pentane

Insolubles) sont élevés 0.501.Compte tenu des résultats nous vous recommandons de nettoyer, rinçer le système et de remplir le

système avec de l'huile caloporteur neuve.

Comments: 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 D
a
te

mm/dd/yy

 

R
e
c
e
iv

e
d
 D

a
te

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

g
e

 

 

S
a
m

p
le

 L
o
c
a
ti
o
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

s
h
 P

o
in

t 
(C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
a
te

r 
(K

F
)

cSt

 

V
is

c
o
s
it
y
 (

4
0
°C

)

mg/KOH/

g

 

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

%wt

 

S
o
lid

s
°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0
%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0
%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

3
5
°C

10/27/20 11/05/20 0h 457 / 236 903.0 56.4    2.11 0.501 740 / 393 852 / 456 955 / 513 1.08 

Baseline Data 414 / 212 43.8 0.41 716 / 380 826 / 441 932 / 500 2.4  

Report ID: [02385534] (Generated: 11/12/2020 09:54:06)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2020 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0

6.4

 

S
a

m
p

le
 D

a
te

 Ir
o

n

 

C
h

ro
m

iu
m

 

N
ic

k
e

l

 
A

lu
m

in
u

m
 

C
o

p
p

e
r

 

L
e

a
d

 T
in  

C
a

d
m

iu
m

 

S
ilv

e
r

 

V
a

n
a

d
iu

m

 

S
ili

c
o

n

 

S
o

d
iu

m

 

P
o

ta
s
s
iu

m

 

T
it
a

n
iu

m

 

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

 

A
n

ti
m

o
n

y

 

M
a

n
g

a
n

e
s
e

 

L
it
h

iu
m

 

B
o

ro
n

 

M
a

g
n

e
s
iu

m

 

C
a

lc
iu

m

 

B
a

ri
u

m

 

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

 

Z
in

c

10/27/20 8 0 0 0 0 7 0 0 0 0 0 6 1 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 1 0 1 4

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 5 250

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

 

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever

with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02385534] (Generated: 11/12/2020 09:54:06)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2020 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

