
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0
3.2

Fluide Thermique
Customer: System Information Sample Information

Motion
1010 de la Rupert
Chicoutimi, QC G7K 0A1 Canada
Attn: EMILIEN 
Tel: (418)545-1570
E-Mail: 

System Volume: 25000 ltr
Bulk Operating Temp: Not Specified
Heating Source: 
Blanket: 

Lab No: 02551551
Analyst: Bill Quesnel CLS,OMA II,MLA-
III,LLA-I 
Sample Date: 04/07/23
Received Date: 04/14/23
Completed: 04/25/23
Bill Quesnel CLS,OMA II,MLA-III,LLA-I

Fluid: TOTAL HTO 21
Make: 

Recommendation: Le fluide peut encore servir. Échantillonner de nouveau l`équipement au prochain intervalle de vidange afin
d`en surveiller la condition.

Comments: Les taux d`usure de tous les composants sont normaux. La teneur en eau est négligeable. Il n`y a aucun indice de
contamination dans le fluide. Le AN est acceptable pour ce fluide.

 

S
am

pl
e 

D
at

e

mm/dd/yy

 

R
ec

ei
ve

d 
D

at
e

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

ge

 

 

S
am

pl
e 

Lo
ca

tio
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

sh
 P

oi
nt

 (
C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
at

er
 (

K
F

)

cSt

 

V
is

co
si

ty
 (

40
°C

)

mg/KOH/
g

 

A
ci

d 
N

um
be

r

%wt

 

S
ol

id
s

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

35
°C

04/07/23 04/14/23 1.0y 446 / 230 7.6 40.5    0.12 0.052 726 / 386 841 / 449 946 / 508 3.02 

Baseline Data 460 / 238 51.2 0.01 804 / 429 849 / 454 891 / 477 0.01 

Report ID: [02551551] (Generated: 04/25/2023 14:37:03)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2023 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0
3.2

 

S
am

pl
e 

D
at

e

 Ir
on  

C
hr

om
iu

m

 

N
ic

ke
l

 
A

lu
m

in
um

 

C
op

pe
r

 

Le
ad  T
in  

C
ad

m
iu

m

 

S
ilv

er

 

V
an

ad
iu

m

 

S
ili

co
n

 

S
od

iu
m

 

P
ot

as
si

um

 

T
ita

ni
um

 

M
ol

yb
de

nu
m

 

A
nt

im
on

y

 

M
an

ga
ne

se

 

Li
th

iu
m

 

B
or

on  

M
ag

ne
si

um

 

C
al

ci
um

 

B
ar

iu
m

 

P
ho

sp
ho

ru
s

 Z
in

c

04/07/23 23 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 3 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 2

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

 

 

 

 

 

Report ID: [02551551] (Generated: 04/25/2023 14:37:03)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2023 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

