
 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0
0.8

ABATTOIR CANARD - process tamis rotatif
Customer: PTRHTF60085 System Information Sample Information

Palmid’Or
230 Rte De La Tramblyronne
Trambly,  71520 FR
Attn: Florent Nauroy
Tel: 
E-Mail: florent.nauroy@ldc.fr

System Volume: 700 ltr
Bulk Operating Temp: 284F / 140C
Heating Source: 
Blanket: 

Lab No: 02640938
Analyst: Bill Quesnel CLS,OMA II,MLA-
III,LLA-I 
Sample Date: 05/21/24
Received Date: 06/10/24
Completed: 06/24/24
Bill Quesnel CLS,OMA II,MLA-III,LLA-I

Fluid: PETRO CANADA PURITY FG HEAT TRANSFER FLUID

Make: 

Recommendation: Le fluide peut encore servir. Échantillonner de nouveau l`équipement au prochain intervalle de vidange afin
d`en surveiller la condition.

Comments: 

 

S
am

pl
e 

D
at

e

mm/dd/yy

 

R
ec

ei
ve

d 
D

at
e

 

 

F
lu

id
 A

ge

 

 

S
am

pl
e 

Lo
ca

tio
n

°F/°C

 

F
la

sh
 P

oi
nt

 (
C

O
C

)

ppm

 

W
at

er
 (

K
F

)

cSt

 

V
is

co
si

ty
 (

40
°C

)

mg/KOH/
g

 

A
ci

d 
N

um
be

r

%wt

 

S
ol

id
s

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 1

0%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 5

0%

°F/°C

 

G
C

D
 9

0%

%

 

G
C

D
 %

 <
 3

35
°C

05/21/24 06/10/24 5.0m 468 / 242 18 36.4    1.02 0.040 730 / 388 824 / 440 915 / 491 2.05 

Baseline Data 459 / 237 37.12 0.90 721 / 383 807 / 431 892 / 478 1.5  

Report ID: [02640938] (Generated: 06/24/2024 13:19:44)  -  Page 1  -  Copyright 2024 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend



 

Sample Rating

0.0 10.0
0.8

 

S
am

pl
e 

D
at

e

 Ir
on  

C
hr

om
iu

m

 

N
ic

ke
l

 
A

lu
m

in
um

 

C
op

pe
r

 

Le
ad  T
in  

C
ad

m
iu

m

 

S
ilv

er

 

V
an

ad
iu

m

 

S
ili

co
n

 

S
od

iu
m

 

P
ot

as
si

um

 

T
ita

ni
um

 

M
ol

yb
de

nu
m

 

A
nt

im
on

y

 

M
an

ga
ne

se

 

Li
th

iu
m

 

B
or

on  

M
ag

ne
si

um

 

C
al

ci
um

 

B
ar

iu
m

 

P
ho

sp
ho

ru
s

 Z
in

c

05/21/24 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 60 0

Baseline Data 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 230

Elemental anaysis results (above) in parts per million (ppm). [10,000 ppm = 1.0%]

Historical Comments

 

 

 

 

 

Petro-Canada makes no representation or warranty of any kind, either express or implied, as to the accuracy or completeness of the analysis and assumes no responsibility and shall have no liability whatsoever
with respect to such analysis, or a party's use of it. Petro-Canada is a division of HollyFrontier Corporation.

Report ID: [02640938] (Generated: 06/24/2024 13:19:44)  -  Page 2  -  Copyright 2024 Wearcheck Inc. All Rights Reserved.

Critical

Abnormal

Normal

Sample Rating Trend

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

