
LIEBHERR 085781 - Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF)
Sample No: LH0224983

Oil Type: DEF (Diesel Exaust Fluid)

ENERGY CRANE SERVICE

19 BOULDER BLVD

STANEY PLAIN, AB

CA  T7Z 1V6

Contact: Service Manager

T: 

F: 

Diagnosis
Fluid meets ISO 22241-2

requirements and is suitable for

use.{not applicable} Appearance is

unacceptable There is no indication

of any contamination in the diesel

exhaust fluid (def). Urea content is

low.

Depot: ENE19STA

Unique No: 5538923

Signed: Kevin Marson

Report Date: 07 Mar 2023

Report Id: ENE19STA [WCAMIS] 02541918 (Generated: 03/07/2024 13:49:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - ENE19STA

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number LH0224983 --- --- ---

Sample Date 03 Feb 2023 --- --- ---

Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---

Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---

Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---

Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---

 CONTAMINATION
Hydrocarbon scalar NONE --- --- ---

 DEF CONDITION

Urea Content % 32.7 --- --- ---

Density @ 20°C g/cm3 1.0871 --- --- ---

Refracting Index 1.3831 --- --- ---

Appearance scalar Clear & Bright --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Sample Color & Clarity

Report Id: ENE19STA [WCAMIS] 02541918 (Generated: 03/07/2024 13:49:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - ENE19STA

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	LIEBHERR LIEBHERR 085781\Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) [LH0224983] 03 Feb 2023 @ .0 hrs

