
LIEBHERR 111985 - Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF)
Sample No: LH0256065

Oil Type: NOT GIVEN

CALGARY METALS (1985) LTD.

3415 OGDEN RD. SE.

CALGARY, AB

CA  T2G 4N4

Contact: Steve Goodzeck

sgoodzeck@calgarymetal.com

T: (403)262-4542

F: 

Diagnosis
Fluid meets ISO 22241-2

requirements and is suitable for

use.{not applicable} There is no

indication of any contamination in the

diesel exhaust fluid (def). Urea

content is low.

Depot: CAL341CAL

Unique No: 5605973

Signed: Kevin Marson

Report Date: 12 Jul 2023

Report Id: CAL341CAL [WCAMIS] 02568927 (Generated: 07/12/2023 07:24:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Steve Goodzeck - CAL341CAL

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number LH0256065 --- --- ---

Sample Date 09 Jul 2023 --- --- ---

Machine Hours 4869 --- --- ---

Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---

Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---

Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---

 CONTAMINATION
Hydrocarbon scalar NONE --- --- ---

 DEF CONDITION

Urea Content % 32.6 --- --- ---

Density @ 20°C g/cm3 1.0895 --- --- ---

Refracting Index 1.3809 --- --- ---

Appearance scalar Clear & Bright --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Sample Color & Clarity

Report Id: CAL341CAL [WCAMIS] 02568927 (Generated: 07/12/2023 07:24:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Steve Goodzeck - CAL341CAL

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	LIEBHERR LIEBHERR 111985\Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) [LH0256065] 09 Jul 2023 @ 4869.0 hrs

