
113718-1216 - Diesel Engine
Sample No: LH

Oil Type: PETRO CANADA DURON UHP 5W30

American Iron and Metal

2555 Sheffield Road

Ottawa, ON

CA  K1B 3V6

Contact: Dan Dupelle

ddupelle@aim-rg.com

T: (613)228-9380

F: (613)745-0692

Diagnosis
Resample at the next service interval

to monitor.All component wear rates

are normal. There is no indication of

any contamination in the oil. The

condition of the oil is acceptable for

the time in service.

Depot: BAKOTT

Unique No: 5671647

Signed: Wes Davis

Report Date: 07 Nov 2023

Report Id: BAKOTT [WCAMIS] 02594568 (Generated: 11/15/2023 23:02:37) Rev: 1 Submitted By: Eric Leblond

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number LH LH0155065 LH0234888 LH

Sample Date 30 Oct 2023 23 Feb 2023 22 Jul 2022 07 Feb 2022

Machine Hours 5676 4729 4000 0

Oil Hours 0 0 0 0

Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed Changed

Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL

 OIL CONDITION
Visc @ 100°C cSt 12.9 12.3 11.6 12.7

Oxidation (PA) % 66 69 79 62

 CONTAMINATION
Soot % % 0 0 0 0

Nitration (PA) % 75 77 83 65

Sulfation (PA) % 53 59 59 54

Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEG

Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 1.2 <1.0

Silicon ppm 6 7 7 6

Sodium ppm 2 2 4 1

Potassium ppm 0 <1 3 4

 WEAR METALS
Iron ppm 3 4 4 4

Copper ppm 2 2 2 2

Lead ppm 1 1 <1 <1

Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 <1

Aluminum ppm 1 1 2 2

Chromium ppm 0 0 0 <1

Molybdenum ppm 57 59 58 58

Nickel ppm <1 0 0 0

Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 0

Silver ppm <1 0 0 <1

Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 <1

Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0

 ADDITIVES
Calcium ppm 998 1128 872 1038

Magnesium ppm 952 997 1117 1015

Zinc ppm 1196 1204 1252 1213

Phosphorus ppm 996 1104 1019 1066

Barium ppm <1 0 0 <1

Boron ppm 2 2 26 2

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: BAKOTT [WCAMIS] 02594568 (Generated: 11/15/2023 23:02:41) Rev: 1 Submitted By: Eric Leblond

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	LIEBHERR 113718-1216\Diesel Engine [LH] 30 Oct 2023 @ 5676.0 hrs

