
72367 TANK DRAIN - Drain Diesel Fuel
Sample No: LH0277731

Oil Type: No.2 DIESEL FUEL (HIGH-SULPHUR)

LIEBHERR CANADA LTD.

1015 SUTTON DRIVE

BURLINGTON, ON

CA  L7L 5Z8

Contact: Joseph Rodgers

joseph.rodgers@liebherr.com

T: (905)319-9222

F: (905)319-6622

Diagnosis
We recommend an early resample to

monitor this condition. Please contact

your representative for information

regarding the proper sampling kits for

your service.{not applicable} There is

no indication of any contamination in

the component(unconfirmed). Not

enough sample submitted to

determine fuel condition and/or

classification.

Depot: LIEMIS

Unique No: 5683128

Signed: Kevin Marson

Report Date: 22 Nov 2023

Report Id: LIEMIS [WCAMIS] 02598048 (Generated: 11/22/2023 11:07:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Joseph Rodgers - LIEMIS

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number LH0277731 --- --- ---

Sample Date 20 Nov 2023 --- --- ---

Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---

Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---

 FUEL CONDITION
Sulfur ppm 518 --- --- ---

Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.6 --- --- ---

 CONTAMINATION
Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---

Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---

Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---

Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---

Silicon ppm 18 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: LIEMIS [WCAMIS] 02598048 (Generated: 11/22/2023 11:07:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Joseph Rodgers - LIEMIS

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	LIEBHERR 72367 TANK DRAIN\Drain Diesel Fuel [LH0277731] 20 Nov 2023 @ .0 hrs

