
LIEBHERR R938 050294-1650 - Swing Drive
Sample No: LH0172358

Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 75W90

MOOREFIELD EXCAVATING LTD.

6297 WELLINGTON RD. 109S, RR #3

HARRISTON, ON

CA  N0G 1Z0

Contact: John Landman

info@moorefieldex.ca

T: (519)343-3571

F: (519)510-3277

Diagnosis
The oil change at the time of

sampling has been noted. We

recommend an early resample to

monitor this condition.Chromium and

iron ppm levels are abnormal. The

low ferrous density (PQ) index

indicates the wear metal levels are

due to corrosion. There is a trace of

moisture present in the oil. The oil is

no longer serviceable as a result of

the abnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: MOOPAL

Unique No: 5709376

Signed: Kevin Marson

Report Date: 15 Jan 2024

Report Id: MOOPAL [WCAMIS] 02608290 (Generated: 01/15/2024 09:51:35) Rev: 1 Submitted By: ?

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number LH0172358 LH0172349 LH0257076 LH0172322

Sample Date 03 Jan 2024 11 Jul 2023 21 Mar 2023 14 Oct 2021

Machine Hours 4951 4478 4098 2273

Oil Hours 0 0 0 0

Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed Changed

Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL

 OIL CONDITION
Visc @ 40°C cSt 102 102 94.5 102

 CONTAMINATION
Water % 0.179 NEG NEG NEG

Silicon ppm 6 3 2 <1

Sodium ppm <1 1 2 <1

Potassium ppm 4 <1 <1 1

 WEAR METALS
PQ 0 --- 0 ---

Iron ppm 1181 460 1179 748

Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 <1

Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 <1

Tin ppm 0 0 0 0

Aluminum ppm 1 <1 0 <1

Chromium ppm 14 5 12 9

Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 <1 0

Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 <1

Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 0

Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1

Manganese ppm 8 3 9 8

Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 0

 ADDITIVES
Calcium ppm 9 10 15 8

Magnesium ppm 1 2 0 0

Zinc ppm 10 10 11 10

Phosphorus ppm 1255 1340 1412 815

Barium ppm 0 <1 0 0

Boron ppm 178 228 62 3

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: MOOPAL [WCAMIS] 02608290 (Generated: 01/15/2024 09:51:38) Rev: 1 Submitted By: ?

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	LIEBHERR LIEBHERR R938 050294-1650\Swing Drive [LH0172358] 03 Jan 2024 @ 4951.0 hrs

