
111446 - Diesel Fuel
Sample No: LH0281076

Oil Type: No.2 DIESEL FUEL (ULTRALOW SULPHUR)

Liebherr Canada

140 - 21320 Gordon Way

Richmond, BC

CA  V6W 1J8

Contact: Kendra Curtis

kendra.curtis@liebherr.com

T: (604)207-4551

F: (604)270-3254

Diagnosis
Please contact your representative

for information regarding the proper

sampling kits for your service.{not

applicable} There is no indication of

any contamination in the

component(unconfirmed). Not

enough sample submitted to

determine fuel condition and/or

classification.

Depot: LIERIC

Unique No: 5709910

Signed: Kevin Marson

Report Date: 17 Jan 2024

Report Id: LIERIC [WCAMIS] 02608824 (Generated: 01/17/2024 13:00:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Kendra Curtis - LIERIC

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number LH0281076 --- --- ---

Sample Date 10 Jan 2024 --- --- ---

Machine Hours 1000 --- --- ---

Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---

 FUEL CONDITION
Sulfur ppm 6 --- --- ---

Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.5 --- --- ---

 CONTAMINATION
Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---

Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---

Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---

Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---

Silicon ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: LIERIC [WCAMIS] 02608824 (Generated: 01/17/2024 13:00:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Kendra Curtis - LIERIC

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	LIEBHERR 111446\Diesel Fuel [LH0281076] 10 Jan 2024 @ 1000.0 hrs

