
LIEBHERR LH30M 144578-1253 - Unknown Component
Sample No: LH0278636

Oil Type: {unknown}

Industrial Metals

550 Messier St.

Winnipeg, MB

CA  R2J 0G5

Contact: Service Manager

T: 

F: 

Diagnosis
This is a baseline read-out on the

submitted sample.{not applicable}

Insufficient sample was received to

conduct all the routine laboratory

tests. {not applicable}

Depot: IND550WIN

Unique No: 5710240

Signed: Kevin Marson

Report Date: 17 Jan 2024

Report Id: IND550WIN [WCAMIS] 02609154 (Generated: 01/18/2024 15:32:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - IND550WIN

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number LH0278636 --- --- ---

Sample Date 15 Jan 2024 --- --- ---

Machine Hours 1200 --- --- ---

Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---

Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---

Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---

 CONTAMINATION
Water % NEG --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: IND550WIN [WCAMIS] 02609154 (Generated: 01/18/2024 15:32:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - IND550WIN

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	LIEBHERR LIEBHERR LH30M 144578-1253\Unknown Component [LH0278636] 15 Jan 2024 @ 1200.0 hrs

