
[(343446)] LIEBHERR LH60M 124381-1217 - Diesel Engine
Sample No: LH0285014

Oil Type: SAE 5W30

RAM IRON AND METAL

60 Ashwarren Road

TORONTO, ON

CA  M3J 1Z5

Contact: PETER RACCO

PETER@RAMIRON.COM

T: (416)630-4545

F: (416)630-5258

Diagnosis
Resample at the next service interval

to monitor.All component wear rates

are normal. There is no indication of

any contamination in the oil. Viscosity

of sample indicates oil is within SAE

40 range, advise investigate. The

condition of the oil is acceptable for

the time in service.

Depot: RAMTOR

Unique No: 5724302

Signed: Kevin Marson

Report Date: 13 Feb 2024

Report Id: RAMTOR [WCAMIS] 02615207 (Generated: 02/13/2024 15:49:50) Rev: 1 Submitted By: ?

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number LH0285014 LH0265839 LH0261593 LH0256687

Sample Date 12 Feb 2024 26 Jun 2023 03 May 2023 02 Apr 2023

Machine Hours 12500 10141 9520 9107

Oil Hours 0 0 0 0

Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed Changed

Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL

 OIL CONDITION
Visc @ 100°C cSt 13.6 13.2 13.7 13.3

Oxidation (PA) % 76 80 68 76

 CONTAMINATION
Water % NEG NEG NEG NEG

Soot % % 0 0 0 0

Nitration (PA) % 80 78 68 82

Sulfation (PA) % 55 57 52 61

Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEG

Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0

Silicon ppm 8 7 7 6

Sodium ppm 1 2 1 2

Potassium ppm 2 <1 0 <1

 WEAR METALS
Iron ppm 4 3 2 3

Copper ppm <1 1 1 <1

Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 <1

Tin ppm 0 0 <1 <1

Aluminum ppm 2 1 1 1

Chromium ppm <1 <1 0 0

Molybdenum ppm 57 58 58 59

Nickel ppm <1 0 0 0

Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 <1

Silver ppm 0 0 0 0

Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 <1

Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0

 ADDITIVES
Calcium ppm 1109 1043 1040 1102

Magnesium ppm 941 978 955 972

Zinc ppm 1176 1194 1155 1196

Phosphorus ppm 993 1051 1079 1064

Barium ppm 0 0 0 0

Boron ppm 2 2 <1 4

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RAMTOR [WCAMIS] 02615207 (Generated: 02/13/2024 15:49:54) Rev: 1 Submitted By: ?

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	LIEBHERR LIEBHERR LH60M 124381-1217\Diesel Engine [LH0285014] 12 Feb 2024 @ 12500.0 hrs

