
LIEBHERR R926 50692 - Grease
Sample No: LH0282823

Oil Type: GREASE

DEMOLITION AM DE L`EST DU QC INC.

261 DE LA PRESQU`ILE ST

CHARLEMAGNE, QC

CA  J5Z 0B4

Contact: Remy Maltais

remy@amdemolition.com

T: 

F: 

Diagnosis
This is a baseline read-out on the

submitted sample.  Please contact us

at 1-800-268-2131 and submit a

Purchase Order for GRS-1 analysis

($195 + HST).{not applicable} Water

and ppm water contamination levels

are abnormal. {not applicable}

Depot: DEMCHA

Unique No: 5750597

Signed: Bill Quesnel

Report Date: 15 Apr 2024

Report Id: DEMCHA [WCAMIS] 02625478 (Generated: 04/15/2024 22:26:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Remy Maltais - DEMCHA

 Sample Information
Sample Number LH0282823 LH0282822 --- ---

Sample Date 27 Mar 2024 27 Mar 2024 --- ---

Machine Hours 1226 1226 --- ---

Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---

Oil Changed N/A N/A --- ---

Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---

 Contamination
Water % 0.185 0.069 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 Graphs

Report Id: DEMCHA [WCAMIS] 02625478 (Generated: 04/15/2024 22:26:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Remy Maltais - DEMCHA

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	LIEBHERR LIEBHERR R926 50692\Grease [LH0282823] 27 Mar 2024 @ 1226.0 hrs

